

LOGIE & COMPANY*1042 Dunvegan Road · West Chester, PA 19382 · Phone 610-430-1987**Fax 610-430-7847 · logieandcompany@verizon.net***Work Log for Services for Jane Herring (#2021 - X2110)****Dates: 08/12/21 - 1/14/22**

Date	Activity	Time in hours
08/12/21	Visit to meet Jane (and son Arthur) in person; also met with Dave Jaskowiak at house; emails and texts with Dave after meeting.	3.75
08/13/21	Call to Dr. Kuhar's office; left VM. Faxed Decree to Dr. Kuhar's ofc. Left VM for Diane Zabowski to call me back re: retaining her for this case. Email to Deb Klock to set up geriatric care assessment in Jane's home. Call with Diane Zabowski re: multiple issues where I might need her assistance. Email from Deb Klock (Karen) with Service Agreement; filled it out and sent back to Karen and gave her more info on the case.	0.75
08/16/21	Call with Deb Klock. Call to Brittany Camp (Jill's attorney); left VM asking for Jill's phone number so I can contact her. Email to son Arthur with multiple questions and info on assessment by Deb Klock. Call from/with Dr. Kuhar.	0.75
08/17/21	Email response from Arthur. Call with Dave Jaskowiak. Emails from/to Deb Klock. Email to Arthur. Email to attorney Ronald Fenstermacher. Email from Ronald Fenstermacher. Call to Matthew Fisher at Raymond James; left VM; email to Matthew with Decree and RE tax bill to be paid. Call from/with Matt Fisher. Email from Arthur. Call to/with accountant Mark Breon; email to Mark. Email from Matt Fisher.	1.25
08/18/21	Email from Arthur asking about my credentials and travel distance from my office to his mom's house. Email to Arthur with answers. Email from attorney Ron Fenstermacher. Email to Arthur responding to his email from yesterday. Email from Deb Klock re: availability for next week; email from Karen for Deb Klock. Email to Arthur re: assessment dates. Email to Arthur re: HO ins, auto ins, life ins, LTC ins, monthly expenses, monthly income. Email to Jill Herring's attorney, Brittany Camp to get Jill's phone number; email from Brittany; email to Brittany. Call to Dr. Kuhar; spoke with Dawn; discussed Jane's vaccines and next appt. Email to Dave Jaskowiak. Call with Dave re: multiple concerns.	2.00

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

08/19/21	<p>Email from Brittany Camp. Email to Brittany. Two emails from Arthur; email back to Arthur with multiple questions. Call from/with Matt Fisher re: Zoom mtg, debit cards, old and new checks, statements, transfer of funds when needed. Another email from Arthur re: date he moved in with mom. Email to Jill. Another email to Arthur re: assessment time/date. Email from Matt Fisher; email back to him. Another email to ARthur re: firearms inventory. Emails from/to ARthur re: assessment. Email to Dave Jaskowiak. Two more emails from Arthur (one of which was very long). Email to Diane Zabowski to hire. Email from Deb Klock; completed her form and emailed back to Deb. Email from Jill; call to Jill; left VM. Call from/to attorney Ron Fenstermacher (both were VMs). Phone call with Deb Klock. Two phone calls with Dave Jaskowiak. Email from Dave. Call (61 min) with Jill. Started working on plan to move Jane.</p>	4.00
08/20/21	<p>Call from Matt Fisher. Call back to/with Matt. Call to Diane Zabowski. Emails from/to Jill Herring. Call to speak with Jane; Arthur answered and said I cannot speak to Jane because she is busy, and then he hung up on me. Call with Jill re: my plan to move Jane to her home; reviewed details and timing of move. Call with attorney Ron Fenstermacher (31 min). Email to Deb Klock canceling her 8/25 assessment. Long detailed email to group re: details of my plan to relocate Jane. Call from Brittany Camp. Call back to/with Brittany re: multiple items.</p>	2.25
08/21/21	<p>Call to auto shop re: car sale; left VM; text to Jonathan at auto shop; call from/with Jonathan; text to Jonathan with details, address, etc. Two emails from Arthur. Email to group (Dave Jaskowiak, Diane Zabowski, Ron Fenstermacher, Jill Herring, Brittany Camp and Deb Klock. Searched online and called Carl Wismer Videography re: videotaping house items for inventory. Two emails from Jill; email back to Jill. Email back to Arthur re: what he called a "medical appointment emergency."</p>	1.00
08/23/21	<p>Two emails from Arthur. Email from Jill. Call to Franconia Police Dept; spoke with Officer Ryan Geist; email to Franconia Police Dept. Email from attorney Ron Fenstermacher. Email to Dave Jaskowiak. Briefly reviewed Petition and attachments. Call to/with Diane Zabowski; forwarded emails from Arthur to Diane. Reviewed parts of the Guardian Petition. Emails from/to Brittany Campre: security system. Another call with Diane. Phone call with Matt Fisher to complete Raymond James form 1089. Call to Jane to check on her; left VM on machine to please call me back. Email from Jill re: security system.</p>	2.50
08/24/21	<p>Email from Matt Fisher. Email to Dale Hoernlein at Raymond James. Call with Jill Herring. Two more emails from Dale H; e-signed their form 1089.</p>	0.75

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

08/25/21	<p>Email from/to Matt Fisher. Call with automotive shop (Vance). Call with Jill. Drove to Jane's house and met with Jill, Vance and two police officers. Three more emails from Matt Fisher; email back to Matt. Call from Dawn at Dr. Kuhar's office; call back to/with Dawn and arranged for Jane's prescription to be picked up by Jill. Second call from/with Jill. Call with Diane Zabowski. Call with Dave Jaskowiak. Email to Jill. Third call with Jill. Call with Kerry, the maid. Email to Arthur. Two more emails from Matt Fisher.</p>	4.00
08/26/21	<p>Emails from/to Jill Herring. Call to Dr. Kuhar's office; spoke with front desk, then left VM on nurse hotline to call me back. Called HOA to introduce myself; left message with answering service for them to return my call. Email from Dale at Raymond James with doc-u-sign to authorize Raymond James to pay RE tax bill during discount period. Four emails from Matt Fisher. Two emails to Matt. Two emails from Dale. Return call from nurse Chrissy (Dr. Kuhar's ofc). Emails from/to Jill. Email to Jill. Email from Jill. Call from Jill (VM). Three-way call with Jill and Brittany Camp. Call from/with Diane Zabowski. Another call with Diane. Email to Diane with notes. Call to Deb Klock to schedule assessment at Jill's house. Emails from/to Jill. Call to HOA; spoke with Janice, then emailed her my Decree. Return call from nurse Chrissy at Dr. Kuhar's ofc. Email from Karen Copestick re: Zoom conference. Email to Karen. Three more emails from Diane; email back to Diane. Organized notes and thoughts to prepare for emergency Zoom conference tomorrow. Call with Deb Klock re: assessment. Email to Deb. Call to State Police to explain who I am and to explain that I moved Jane to daughter Jill's house. Went online to change Jane's mailing address to mine. Another call with Diane Zabowski re: Zoom conference tomorrow. Another email to Diane.</p>	5.25
08/27/21	<p>Email to Diane Zabowski. Email from Diane. Email back to Diane. Call with Diane before conference. Conference with Judge Weilheimer. Call with Jill Herring. Email to Judge Weilheimer. Email from Matt Fisher; scheduled 30-min "onboarding" meeting with him. Emails to/from Matt. Emails from/to Diane. Email to Deb Klock to reschedule in-home assessment. Another email from Matt Fisher; email back to him. Call with Jane later in day. Emails from Deb Klock and Jill re: assessment. Email to Jill.</p>	2.50
08/30/21	<p>Email from Arthur Herring with multiple questions. Email back to Arthur, responding to his questions and asking him a question. Email to Jill Herring for an update. Call from/with Diane Zabowski. Email from Arthur. Email to Dale at Raymond James. Emails from/to Arthur. Emails from/to Jill. Email to Diane. Call with Dr. Kuhar. Email to Jill re: Dr. Kuhar. Email from Jill.</p>	1.25

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

08/31/21	<p>Long email from Arthur Herring. Call from Dr. Kuhar's office (Dawn). Email from Jill Herring. Call back to Dawn at Dr. Kuhar's office. Email back to Jill. Email to Diane Zabowski. Call from/with Diane. Call with Raymond James (Matt); created new user name/password; reviewed account details and goals; reviewed online access tools. Two more emails from Jill; email back to Jill. Call to Grandview Hospital; spoke with Sue then with Mary Jane's VM (Health Info Mgt Dept); left msg to call me back. Another call from Dr. Kuhar's office. Email from Dr. Kuhar's office. Filled out "portal" form and emailed back to Dawn at Dr. Kuhar's office. Forwarded to Diane Zabowski all emails sent to me by Arthur Herring (per Diane's request). Call from/with Deb Klock. Emails from/to Dawn at Dr. Kuhar's office.</p>	2.50
09/01/21	<p>Emails from/to Brittany Camp. Emails from/to Dawn at Dr. Kuhar's office. Email to Jill Herring re: COVID vaccine for Jane. Email from GVH Hospital re: sign-up process for portal; signed up for access. Call with Jill. Call to Uninvest Bank; spoke with Tom. Drove to Uninvest Bank branch; met with Tom; closed Jane's account and requested statements for last nine months. Email from Tom after meeting; email to Tom. Started reviewing statements and check images.</p>	2.00
09/02/21	<p>Long email from Arthur Herring. Emails from/to Tom at Uninvest Bank. Call with Dave Jaskowiak.</p>	0.25
09/03/21	<p>Email from Arthur Herring making what I call a veiled threat against my own mother. Email to Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane. Call with Dave Jaskowiak. Call to 911. Call from Willistown Police Dept. Call to Franconia Police Dept. Texts with Dave Jaskowiak. Emails from/to Brittany Camp.</p>	1.00
09/06/21	<p>Multiple emails with Jill Herring. Call with nurse practitioner (Polly) at Dr. Kuhar's office.</p>	0.25
09/07/21	<p>Emails from/to Jill Herring. Email to Deb Klock. Call to Deb. Visit to Jane at Jill's house. Text to automotive shop; call with automotive shop. Email from Matt at Raymond James. Call with Diane Zabowski. Call to CVS Pharmacy. Email to Diane. Call from NP Polly. Email from Diane Z. Emails from/to Jill Herring. Emails from/to Arthur Herring. Email from GVH Medical portal. Email to Diane Z. Fax to Samantha at CVS Pharmacy.</p>	4.50
09/08/21	<p>Call to Rann Pharmacy. Call to Skippack Pharmacy. Call with Collegeville Pharmacy and signed up for new RX service. Email to Bhavana at pharmacy. Email from Jill Herring. Call from Deb Klock. Email to Diane Z. Call from Diane Z. Email to Arthur Herring. Another call to Diane. Call to CVS Pharmacy. Emails from/to Matt Fisher. Another call with Diane. Email to Diane. Emails from/to pharmacy.</p>	2.75

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

09/09/21	Email from Arthur Herring. Email from Court. Email from Diane. Email from Jill Herring. Email from pharmacy. Call with Jill. Emails from/to Diane. Call with Deb Klock. Email to Deb. Text to Deb. Call with Diane. Two calls with Deb. Call to Dr. Kuhar's office. Another text from/to Deb. Lengthy email from Arthur Herring.	1.50
09/10/21	Two calls from Dr. Kuhar while she was on vacation. Call back to Dr. Kuhar. Emails from/to Diane. Emails from/to Jill Herring. Call with Diane Zabowski. Calls to three memory care facilities. Call with Adrian from Meadowood. Call from Bhavana. Activated new debit card from Raymond James. Call to Deb Klock. Email to Deb Klock. Call to West Chester SS office; waited on hold; spoke with rep; gave info and scheduled phone appt. Email to Jill Herring. Email from Matt Fisher. Call with Deb Klock. Faxed requested info to West Chester SS office.	3.25
09/11/21	Two calls with Jill Herring. Four emails from Jill. Email to Jill. Email from Arthur Herring. Email to Arthur (9/12/21).	0.50
09/12/21	Call with Jill Herring. Four emails from Jill. Email to Jill. Email from Arthur Herring.	0.25
09/13/21	Two emails from Jill. Call with Diane. Call to Dr. Kuhar's office. Completed Meadowood admissions application along with all supporting documents. Email from Dr. Kuhar. Emails from/to Jill. Another email to Meadowood. Two calls with Jill. Call with Meadowood. Email to Diane. Phone call to Diane. Call to Einstein Norristown Hospital. Email from Jill. Call with Dr. Asaly at Einstein.	2.50
09/14/21	Call from Dr. Ricci at Einstein. Emails from/to Meadowood. Emails from/to Jill. Email from Meadowood. Call with Diane in anticipation of conference with Judge tomorrow. Email from Janice Shearer re: mobile home parked at Jane's house. Another call with Diane. Email to Arthur. Call to Einstein Hospital to check on Jane. Fax to hosp.	1.75
09/15/21	Call with Diane. Email to Janice Shearer. Another email from/to Janice. Another call to Diane. Email from Jill. Call from Jill. Email to Diane. Email from Diane. Another phone call with Jill. Two calls with Einstein Hosp. Email to Jill. Call with Einstein social worker. Email to Jill. Email from/to Arthur.	2.50
09/16/21	Two emails from Dr. Kuhar. Email back to Dawn at Dr. Kuhar's office. Another email from Dawn; email back to Dawn. Call with Meadowood. Call to Einstein SW. Email to Diane. Call to Dock Woods. Call to Peter Becker; left VM for Kim. Call to Mobile Help Medical Alert; waited on hold; spoke with Charnee; got all the info to send equipment back and close out acct. Email to Arthur requesting he send back equipment to Mobile Help. Three-way call with Dave J and Diane Z. Emails from/to Jill. Call from Dr. Kuhar re: Arthur's continuous harassment. Call from Kim at Peter Becker. Email to Jill Herring.	2.25

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

09/17/21	Called Philadelphia Inquirer; waited on hold; canceled Jane's subscription with Colleen. Call from/with Laura at auto shop. Email to Laura. Email from Arthur Herring. Call to Frederick Living; left VM for Lisa in Admissions to call me. Call from/with Lisa; she will email me with application. Call with SW Elton at Einstein Hosp for update on Jane and for him to fax medical record to Frederick Living. Email to Lisa after reviewing lengthy application.	1.25
09/18/21	Call to Einstein Hosp to check on Jane; left VM for aide to nurse Ashley to call me back. Email from/to Jill Herring. Second call to speak with nurse; left VM; call with nurse Ashley about Jane.	0.25
09/20/21	Email from Jill Herring. Call with Deb Klock. Three-way call with Deb and SW Elton at Einstein. Email from/to Jill. Call from/with Jill. Emails from/to Diane Zabowski.	0.50
09/21/21	Emails from/to Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane. Went to automotive shop to sign doc for sale of car. Call from/with SS office in West Chester to become Rep Payee. Emails to/from Jill Herring. Second call with Diane. Call from Elton at Einstein. Call to Frederick Living to check on status of application; left VM for Lisa; Megan and Lisa gone for day. Call from/with Dr. Kuhar.	2.25
09/22/21	Emails from/to Diane Zabowski. Call to Frederick Living; spoke with Megan, then left VM for Daniel to call me back. Call to/with Deb Klock. Call to Rock Hill Mennonite; spoke with Erin in Admissions; they do not have Memory Care Unit. Call from Jill Herring. Email from Jill re: Arthur at hospital. Email to Diane. Call to Einstein; spoke with nurse Anthony re: Arthur's visit earlier today when Security made him leave. Call with Diane. Two more emails from Jill. Email to Jill. Call from nurse manager Tom re: Arthur's visit this AM; call to Tom; email to Tom. Call with Daniel at Frederick Living.	2.00
09/23/21	Call with Diane Zabowski. VM from SW Elton. Call with Souderton Mennonite (Jen). Email to SW Elton. Text to Deb Klock. Call with Deb Klock. Second call with Jen at Souderton Mennonite. Another call with Deb Klock re: Phoebe NH. Call to Phoebe (Mitch H); left VM to call me back. Call with Diane. Call from Daniel at Frederick Living.	1.75
09/24/21	Three calls with Elton (Einstein SW). Call to Deb Klock. Call with Deb Klock. Call with Phoebe Admissions. Email from Phoebe. Started filling out application for Phoebe. Drove to West Chester SS office and dropped off raised-seal copy of Guardian Decree per request of SS during Rep Payee interview. Created filebox to organize Jane's paperwork. Call with Nancy G at ins co; email to Nancy re: HO insur, auto insur and umbrella insur.	2.25

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

09/27/21	Email from SW Elton at Einstein. Call to Phoebe (Angela in Adm); left VM. Finished filling out paperwork for Phoebe admission. Email to Elton. Email from Angela at Phoebe. Another call to Angela. Another email to Elton. Call with Deb Klock. Two more emails from Elton. Two calls with Arden Court (Alexis). Email to Elton. Email from HO insur co (Nancy G). Signed, scanned and emailed form to Nancy. Two more Emails from Elton. Another two emails to Elton.	1.75
09/28/21	Two emails from SW Elton. Two emails from Tom Cleary (nurse at Einstein). Email to Diane Zabowski. Email to Elton. Email to Diane re: legal bill from attorney Dorothy Weik-Hange. Call with Deb Klock. Filled out app for Manatawny Manor. Called Manatawny to ask how to get the completed app to them; left VM. Call from/with Lisa Johns at Manatawny. Email to Lisa. Email from Lisa. Emails to/from Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane. Three emails from Elton. Email from Deb Klock. Email to nurse Tom Cleary. Email to Dr. Kuhar. Call with Deb Klock.	2.75
09/29/21	Emails from/to Jill Herring. Call to Lisa Johns at Manatawny. Email to Lisa. Call with Elton. Filled out second app for Manatawny (six pages). Texts to/from Deb Klock. Call with Deb. Call with Lisa Johns. Email to Diane Zabowski. Two calls with Einstein re: COVID test. Email to Jill and Arthur informing them of COVID test results. Call with Diane Z. Call with Jill. Email to Janice Shearer.	2.50
09/30/21	Call (VM) from Matt Fisher at Raymond James. Call back to Matt; left VM. Call (VM) from Matt. Call to/with Matt.	0.25
10/01/21	Emails with Jill Herring. Call to auto shop (Laura). Wrote check to reimburse Jill.	0.25
10/04/21	Email from Lion's Gate HO Assoc re: RV still parked in driveway. Email to Diane Zabowski. Email from Diane. Calls from/to Bhavana at pharmacy. Call to Diane; left VM. Call from/with Lion's Gate Management Co (Janice).	0.50
10/05/21	Call from/with Diane Zabowski. Call to Einstein to get update on Jane; spoke with Danielle. Email to Diane. Call from Dr. Motuvalli from Einstein Hospital.	0.50
10/06/21	Email from Diane Zabowski. Email to Diane. Email to nurse mgr at Einstein Hosp. Call to Aetna; spoke with Giselle. Another all with Aetna; spoke with GiGi; put on hold multiple times; faxed them info. Emails from/to Tom Cleary at Einstein. Emails from/to Elton at Einstein. Emails from/to Jill Herring. Emails from/to Matt Fisher. Call from Lisa Johns at Manatawny.	1.50

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

10/07/21	Call from Matt Fisher. Email from Janice Shearer. Three emails from Diane Zabowski. Two emails from Dave Jaskowiak. Emails to/from Matt Fisher. Call with Barb and Buxmont Accounting. Seven emails from Buxmont Accounting; logged in to their portal; created acct; printed out multiple forms; experienced server error on portal; email to Mark re: the error; phone call with Barb re: the error. Call with Jill. Paid IRS invoice. Paid PA Dept Rev invoice. Paid Buxmont Accounting invoice. Call with Deb Klock.	2.25
10/08/21	Email from Nancy Gurney. Email to Diane Zabowski. Went on to RJ Online to confirm insurance refund. Email to Nancy G. Call with Diane.	0.50
10/10/21	Call with doctor at Einstein with update on Jane and status of discharge. Email to lawyers with update.	0.25
10/11/21	Call from nurse at Einstein. Email to Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane. Call with SW Elton at Einstein.	0.50
10/13/21	Email from Nancy Gurney. Email back to Nancy. Call with Einstein (Elton). Call to Diane Zabowski. Email to Diane. Email from Buxmont Accounting; signed on to their portal; completed IRS form and returned it to Buxmont. Call from Lisa Johns at Manatawny. Email to Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane. Call to Franconia Twp Sewer Authority and paid bill online.	1.50
10/14/21	Call from Jill Herring. Call to Dr. Peters (DPM) re: old invoice I received; spoke with Karen and paid bill.	0.25
10/15/21	Call from Lisa Johns at Manatawny. Email from Lisa with 37 pages of paperwork. Email from Nancy Gurney. Email to Nancy. Call with SW Elton from hospital. Call with Diane Zabowski. Email from Diane. Email to Elton and Tom at hospital re: the report of Jane's eyeglasses being missing. Completed paperwork for Manatawny; scanned and emailed to Lisa Johns.	1.25
10/18/21	Email from Lisa Johns. Emails from/to Jill Herring. Email to Dave Jaskowiak. Email to Lisa Johns. Email from Dave J. Email to Attorney Fenstermacher. Call with Jill re: multiple concerns she has. Call with Elton (SW). Email from Elton. Email to Diane Zabowski. Additional email to Diane. Two more emails from Lisa Johns. Email back to Lisa. Call with Joe, exec dir at Manatawny.	1.50
10/19/21	Emails from/to Lisa Johns. Email to Diane Zabowski. Email from Ron Fenstermacher. Email to Manatawny dietitian. Email to Diane. Email to Lisa J. Emails from/to Ron Fenstermacher. Another remail to Diane. Email to Lisa Johns. Email from Jill Herring re: a deck repair invoice. Call to James Saylor re: deck invoice.	0.75
10/20/21	Call from James Saylor. Email to James. Three emails from Lisa Johns. Email to Matt Fisher. Email from Matt. Created monthly budget with expenses and income. Call with Nancy Gurney. Email to Diane Zabowski. Two emails to Lisa Johns. Two emails from Lisa. Email back to Lisa.	1.75

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

10/21/21	Email from HO Insurance co (Nancy Gurney). Email to Nancy. Reviewed policy from Nancy. Email from Nancy. Email to Diane Zabowski. Email from Diane. Email from James Saylor. Email to James. Another email to Nancy Gurney.	0.75
10/22/21	Email from Nancy Gurney. Call to Nancy. Email from Nancy. Paid HO insur policy with electronic check. Call with Diane Zabowski re: four different issues: deck repair bill; occupancy of Jane's house; order to spend principal; HO insur policy. Second call with Diane. Email to Ron Fenstermacher with deck bill and explanation.	0.75
10/25/21 - 10/27/21	Emails from/to Nancy Gurney. Signed document from Nancy; scanned and emailed back to her. Email from Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane. Email from Lisa Johns. Call to Aetna; spoke with George re: fax I sent him with Court Order for Guardianship. Signed up for Aetna online access. Call from/with Jill Herring. Multiple emails from Aetna after I signed up for online access. Email to Lisa Johns. Submitted Guardian Inventory on GTS and paid fee online.	2.50
10/28/21	Emails back and forth with Nancy Gurney. Signed, scanned and emailed form to Nancy G. Email to Diane Zabowski. Email from Deb Klock with six-page invoice. Email from Diane Z.	0.50
10/29/21	Call from/with Jill Herring. Email to Lisa Johns re: three items. Two emails from Lisa. Completed form, scanned and emailed to Lisa. Another email to Lisa. Email to Matt Fisher at RJ.	0.50
11/01/21	Email from Diane Zabowski with multiple questions plus an invoice from Arthur Herring for Jane's glasses. Call with Diane Z. Call to Jill Herring. Email to Diane re: multiple issues. Call from Jill.	0.75
11/02/21	Call from Jill Herring re: visitation schedule change. Call to Lisa Johns. Email to Ron Fenstermacher.	0.50
11/03/21	Email from Ron Fenstermacher. Email from Lisa Johns with fifteen-page care plan. Read over and reviewed it. Call to Dr. Kuhar's office re: flu and pneumonia vaccines. Email back to Lisa Johns. Email from Lisa. Call with Diane Zabowski. Email from Diane. Looked up info on Dr. Godfrey online to call him tomorrow.	1.00
11/04/21	Call to Dr. Godfrey; spoke with Shannon; emailed Court Decree. Call with Lisa Johns re: eye dr. appt transportation. Email to Lisa to set up eye care in-house for Jane. Email to Diane Zabowski. Call from nurse Hayley at Manatawny re: multiple issues. Emails from/to Deb Klock. Call from Diane Z. Email from Diane Z. Email from Lisa J. Completed form and returned to Lisa.	1.50
11/08/21	Call to SS office in West Chester; waited on hold; spoke with Miss Rice. Call from Diane Zabowski. Two calls to Manatawny. Email to Lisa Johns. Call to/with Jane Herring at Manatawny.	1.00

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

11/09/21	Long call with nurse Hayley at Manatawny. Call (VM) to Montco OC. Email to Montco OC requesting two raised-seal copies of Guardian Decree. Email from Montco OC. Call from/with Diane Zabowski re: multiple issues for a potential conference with Judge Weilheimer. Second call with Diane Z.	0.75
11/10/21	Call from/with Diane Zabowski after her Zoom conference with Judge. Call from Jean Wassel (personal care admin at Manatawny). Went to visit Jane at Manatawny. Also met with nurse Hayley and director Jean Wassel. Call with Deb Klock. Email from Jean Wassel. Email to Diane Z. Did not charge for full travel due to seeing another ward on return to office.	2.75
11/11/21	Emails from/to Lisa Johns. Call with Jill Herring. Second call with Jill. Call with Diane Zabowski. Second call with Diane Z.	0.75
11/13/21	Call from Jill Herring (VM). Two calls with Jill. Email from Jill.	0.25
11/15/21	Call from Jill Herring. Email from Jill. Email to Jill. Call to Diane Zabowski. Email to Diane. Second call with Diane. Email from Diane with radio broadcast link with Arthur Herring being interviewed on air. Call with Jill.	0.75
11/16/21	Call from/with Diane Zabowski. Call from/with Dave Jaskowiak. Received Arthur Herring's website link from Dave Jaskowiak. Two emails from Matt Fisher (11/1/21). Seceduled annual review meeting with Matt Fisher.	0.50
11/17/21	Emails from/to Diane Zabowski. Emails from/to James Saylor re: his invoice. Email to Ron Fenstermacher re: James Saylor's invoice. Email from Ron. Went to West Chester office of SS to drop off Guardian Decree and letter. Went to auto shop to pick up check for sale of car. Phone call with Diane Z. Compiled list of monthly house expenses and emailed to Diane.	1.50
11/18/21	Emails from/to Diane Zabowski. Call with Matt Fisher (RJ) re: quarterly review of portfolio. Call to Computershare re: letter I received re: IBM investment; waited on hold; spoke with Denise; mailed original Decree with raised seal to them. Email from Ron Fenstermacher.	0.75
11/19/21	Two calls with Diane Zabowski. Three emails from Arthur Herring (last night). Two emails from Jill Herring. Call to Manatawny re: health issue with Jane. Reply email to Arthur re: numerous issues. Emails from/to Diane Z. Email to Jill re: visit on Thanksgiving Day for Arthur. Email to Lisa Johns that Arthur is allowed to visit his mother on Thanksgiving. Second email to Arthur re: Thanksgiving Day visit schedule.	1.75

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

11/20/21	Saturday. Two calls from Manatawny (nurse Diane Moser). Called to set up account at Professional Pharmacy in Pottstown for Jane's needs; was told to call billing dept which is not open on weekends. Nurse Diane reported that she removed sharp pruning shears from Jane's room. Call later in day from Manatawny nurse. Called back and spoke to Jean Wassel who reported that Arthur Herring called an ambulance to go to his mother at Manatawny. Jean reported that this caused distraction and confusion for them and that ambulance was not needed.	0.50
11/21/21	Call from nurse Diane Moser re: Arthur Herring continually calling unit. Call from/with Dave Jaskowiak re: Petition for Contempt and to give him new information.	0.25
11/22/21	Email from Ron Fenstermacher. Call to Ron. Two emails from Jill Herring. Called Professional Pharmacy in Pottstown (Diane) to set up account for Jane. Email from Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane Z. Email from Ron Fenstermacher.	0.75
11/23/21	Email from Diane Zabowski. Call to Diane. Email from Jill Herring. Email from Diane Z. Email to Jill. Call to Manatawny to check on what dr. says about Jane's health issue. Spoke with nurse Theresa who read me Dr.'s notes. Email to Jill and Arthur with update on Jane's condition.	0.75
11/29/21	Long email from Arthur Herring (Sunday, 11/28/21). Emails from/to Deb Klock. Email to Jean Wassel and Lisa Johns with Living Will. Email to Deb Klock and Jean Wassel re: need for medical alert. Call from Diane Zabowski.	0.50
12/03/21 & 12/06/21	Email to Jill Herring. Call from/with Jill. Three emails from Jill. Email to Jean Wassel.	0.50
12/07/21	Email from Arthur Herring. Email from Diane. Call to Dr. Bruder; spoke with Dr.'s staff. Call to Jill Herring. Return call from Jill. Call from Joe T, Manatawny Administrator. Email from Joe re: Arthur's behavior. Call from Dr. Bruder. Email to Arthur with update on Jane's legs.	1.25
12/08/21	Email from Arthur Herring (last night). Two calls with Joe T. re: Arthur calling police to facility. Emails from/to Ron Fenstermacher. Call with Diane Zabowski. VM from Jill Herring.	1.00
12/09/21	Call to East Coventry Police Dept; left VM. Call with Diane Zabowski. Email from Ron Fenstermacher.	0.25
12/10/21	Emails from/to Diane Zabowski. Call from Joe T. Call to East Coventry PD; spoke with Cheryl re: incident report. Email to Joe T. Another call with Joe T. Call with Manatawny med tech, Meghan. Email from PD. Two emails to Arthur Herring.	1.00

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

12/13/21	Read three emails from Arthur Herring. Email from Diane Zabowski with Arthur's petition to remove me. Read over petition and started to formulate my answers. Email from Deb Klock. Tried to deposit two checks via mobile deposit at Raymond James. Email to Matt Fisher re: mobile deposit not working. Email from Matt Fisher. Call with Jill Herring. Email from Diane. Call from Deanna Sariol-Clough at Chester County PS. Email to Deanna with info she requested. Another email from Diane.	1.50
12/14/21	Email from Deanna at PS. Call from Jill Herring. Email to Jean Wassel. Call with Diane Zabowski. Second call with Diane. Reviewed numerous emails to find info for the contempt hearing. Emails from Diane.	1.00
12/15/21	Call with Diane Zabowski. Emails from/to Diane. Call from Jill Herring. Emails from Jill. Attended contempt hearing. Call with Diane after hearing. Email from Jean Wassel.	6.00
12/16/21	Call from Dave Jaskowiak. Call to Manatawny to check on Jane. Email to Jean Wassel. Two emails from Jean. Email to Jean. Call from Jill Herring asking for return call. Call back to Jill.	0.50
12/17/21	Emails from/to Diane Zabowski. Call from Diane. Call with Matt Fisher. Compiled financial info for Deanna at PS and emailed to her as requested. Email to Ron Fenstermacher.	1.25
12/20/21	Email from Diane Zabowski. Call from Diane. Call back to Diane. Call from Jill Herring. Call back to Jill.	0.25
12/21/21	Call with Ron Fenstermacher. Call from Arthur Herring. Email to Jean Wassel. Call to Manatawny. Called Arthur; left VM. Email to Arthur. Email to Deb Klock. Second call from Arthur leaving his name and number and nothing else. Call to Manatawny to check on Jane.	0.50
12/22/21	Two emails from Jill Herring. Email back to Jill. Email from Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane. Email to Diane. Reviewed large pile of mail; sorted, filed, trashed. Email to Matt Fisher. Paid ambulance bill. Reviewed Manatawny bill. Sent the bill to Ron Fenstermacher for him to pay. Email to Jill. Mailed two checks to Raymond James.	2.25
12/23/21	Email from Arthur Herring (last night). Two emails from Jill Herring. Call with Jill. Two emails from Matt Fisher. Email to Arthur. Email to Jean Wassel. Second email to Arthur re: heater maintenance. Paid C&C Heating invoice. Call to C&C Heating. Email from Arthur.	1.00
12/24/21	Two emails from Arthur. Reviewed two letters from IRS and one from PA Revenue. Scanned and emailed two IRS letters and one PA Revenue letter to CPA. Emails from/to Diane Zabowski.	0.25
12/27/21	Email from Jill Herring (yesterday). Email to Joe T and Jean Wassel. Emails from/to Heidi Carlson at CCPS. Second email from/to Heidi. Call to Heidi.	0.50

Jane Herring Work Log 8-12-21 through 1-14-22

12/30/21	Two emails from Arthur Herring (yesterday). Email to Arthur (yesterday). Call from Jean Wassel. Call back to Jean. Call to Jill Herring; left VM. Email from CCPS. Call to CCPS. Return call from Jill. Email to Jean Wassel. Email to Arthur Herring. Email to Joe T and Jean W. Email to Deanna at CCPS. Email to Deb Klock. Email from/to Deanna. Two more emails from Deanna.	1.25
01/03/22	Email from Jill Herring two days ago. Email from Jill yesterday. Email from Arthur yesterday. Email from Arthur. Email to Diane Zabowski. Emails from/to Matt Fisher. Call to Manatawny; spoke with Meghan. Call to Dr. Bruder's office. Email from Diane. Call with Diane. Call with Deb Klock.	1.25
01/04/22	Organized thoughts and wrote up notes to review with Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane to review all the accusations Arthur made about me in his petition to remove me.	0.75
01/05/22	Email to Diane Zabowski. Call from Buxmont Accounting. Wrote checks to pay IRS and PA Revenue.	0.25
01/06/22	Call from Buxmont Accounting. Email from Diane Zabowski with all her answers to Arthur Herring's petition to remove me. Email to Diane. Paid sewer bill. Paid "Foot & Ankle" bill and changed address to my own.	1.00
01/10/22	Emails with Diane Zabowski. Call with Diane. Reviewed email from Deb Klock with multiple invoices. Email to Karen re: Deb's invoices. Email from Karen. Email to Ron Fenstermacher. Second call with Diane. Email to Diane.	1.25
01/11/22	Call from Jill Herring. Call to Jill. Another call from Jill. Email to Jean Wassel. Two emails from Jill. Call to PNC Investments; spoke with Natalie. Emailed PNC my decree and instructions. Call to Manatawny to check on Jane.	1.00
01/14/22	Call to 360 Care. Call to Manatawny; left VM for Joe T. Email to Lisa Johns at Manatawny.	0.25
	Total	138.75
	133.00 hours @ \$115 per hour	\$15,295.00
	5.75 hours @ \$125 per hour	\$718.75
	Parking fee for Contempt Hearing 12/15/21	\$8.00
	Balance Due	\$16,021.75