BLUMER VARIOUS DOCUMENTS

1. More extreme visit restrictions by the mafia to Mother and me without any proof those restrictions were

ever needed and NO proof by the mafia that | had ever done anything to have them. The mafia refused to
prove their fake accusations in court and when | filed a petition for them to do so in September 2023,
jaskowiak, camp, gelsinger and fenstermacher begged judge sterling to deny my petition. She did.

2. pam blumer’s claimed work experience. She claimed before she.was hired she was a certified guardian. She
lied. | discovered she never was. After being hired to be the guardian of person for my 97 year old Mother,

she still pever became certified. Her lawyer husband was good friends of jaskowiak.

3. | had sent my then lawyer a letter telling him that my Mother had refused to get a flu shot until she talked
to me. It proved how much my Mother trusted me and counted on me. Blumer had told me she wanted me
to get a chair for Mother to sit down in the shower. Who the hell is blumer to tell me what to do? She is the
guardian of person at $125 an hour Mother is paying her. Blumer’s job is to serve Mother.

4. In the beginning, | contacted blumer so she could meet me and for her to see how Mother was living before
she was kidnapped by logie and jsh. Blumer never wanted any meeting. Why would she thing she could
make Mother happy if she did not know how Mother was living?

5. By about September 2023, | was tired of seeing my good name being used by the mafia for 2 years to claim |
was doing many bad things to Mother, including making her legs swollen, making her “agitated”, etc. The
mafia used their own lies to restrict and deny visits with Mother. I filed a petition that month for them to
either “prove | am a danger or menace to Mother, in other words either defecate or get off of the toilet.
The mafia, including blumer, jaskowiak, jsh, etc, replied to sterling they demanded my petion be denied.
Sterling did what they wanted. Don’t lawyers know in this countery a person is innocent until proven guilty
in a court of law?

6. A page of some, of many, many, wasteful billing hours blumer/her lawyers demand Mother pay for. Blumer
hired them as part of her business. It is HER responsibility to pay them as a expense in her business. In
addition, the mafia, especially jaskowiak, was trying to get the DA to file criminal charges against me for
wiretapping for supposed videotaping Mother with my ceil phone. Blumer’'s lawyer, gelsinger, was told to
contact a DA detective, Kelly, about daing so by weilheimer. Why would weilheimer get involved with
getting the DA involved for the mafia’s benefit of prosecuting me and trying to put me in prison again, as
jaskowiak had done twice before? The fact was the mafia was determined to put me into prison again as
punishment for exposing their scam on Mother.

7. Pam blumer had lied when she told my former lawyer and t that she was certified to be 2 guardian. She
never was certified. | proved she wasn't. The guardian association removed the title from her name.

8. On blumer’s invoice, she states that in July 2023, there were 41 active cases of covid. About 39% of the

people who died from covid, die in nursing homes. Mother got covid once
in the hospital that her daughter jsh put her in because jsh had starved Mother while she was being kept a
prison in jsh’s house after Mother was kidnapped in August 25, 2021. Mother got covid again at the pig

pen. Why would blumer keep Mother there instead of a much nicer, much bigger and much cheaper place

to live, like Mother's home of 21 years. Why would blumer allow Mother to live in that low rated nursing

home that had just reopened in October 2021 after a major covid shutdown of

many months? Why would blumer keep Mother in a tiny locked in section, in solitary confinement, in a
sensory deprived environment, with people with mental and behavior problems (Mother never had any),
no phone, no visitors, not allowed at any time to go home to be with her much loved possessions of
almost 100 years? Is that blumer’s idea of being a guardian to a 97, 98 year old woman? The other pages
deal with the massive billing hours by blumer and the lawyers she hired and billed Mother for. Those



charges were blumer’s expense of having a business.
9. Some of the massive, massive billing hours of the various lawyers blumer hire to make more money for
them and her hushand/lawyer bill, who is good friends with jaskowiak.
10. Because of my constant pressure on pam blumer to fix the many problems of Mother being kept under
ownership of the mafia, blumer finally quit. But she attacked me as her excuse. She claimed she liked my
Mother, so why did she ignore the many problems I found affecting Mother’s health and happiness at 97,
98 yearsold? _
11. My response to pam blumer’s quitting. Good riddance, bitch. She admitted she only saw Mother once a
month for only a hour. What good was blumer doing at only one hour a menth?
12. Blumer blaming me for her quitting and the massive amount of money she/her lawyers stole from Mother
without doing anything to help Mother and to make her happy.
13. Order for sterling to sign giving blumer/husband and the lawyers he hired in his [aw firm money from
Mother for WHAT for Mother’s benefit?



Barley Snyder .

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

2755 CENTURY BLVD. | : William R. Blumer, Esquire CELA
WYOMISSING, PA 19610 E-mail: whlumer@barley.com
TEL (610) 372-3500 FAX (610} 372-8671
WWW.BARLEY.COM

July 22, 2022

Via Electronic Mail and Regular Mail

Brittany J. Camp, Esquire A. Victor Meitner, Ir., Esquire
1001 Conshohocken State Road 564 Skippack Pike
Suite 1-300 Blue Beli, PA 19422

West Conshohocken, PA 19428

David A. Jaskowiak, Esquire
815 Greenwood Avenue
Suite 14

Jenkintown, PA 19046

Re:  New Procedures for Visitation with Jane Herring

Dear Counsel:

In accordance with Judge Weilhimer’s instructions to e during the July 20, 2022 status
conference, I am writing to confirm the new visitation procedure for Jane Herring that my client
is directing. I will certainly entertain any feedback any of you may wish to provide, but please
understand that these new procedures are effective immediately subject to my client’s ability to
modify them in the future if she believes that is appropriate. They are intended to apply to both
Jilt and Arthur, although I think it is abundantly clear that they are aimed squarely at addressing
Arthur’s past behavior that has been inappropriate and upsetting to Jane.

The new procedures are as follows:

L. All visits between Jane Herring and her children are to occur in the dining room at
Manatawny Marnor. Visits will continue to occur on the dates and times and for the duration set
forth in the court’s earlier order. Staff at Manatawny Manar may elect to sit with Jane during
these visits, so there should be no expectation on the part of Jane’s children that their visits with
their mother will be private. If the staff at Manatawny Manor believes Jane is becoming upset
during a visit, they have the authority to take Jane back to her room so that Jane can regain her
composure. If the allotted time for the visit expires while Jane is recovering her composure, 1o
additional visitation time will be permitted, and the child will need to return at his or her next
scheduled visiting time.

98118501
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2. Neither of Jane’s children are to visit with Jane in her room. In fact, they may not
enter Jane’s room for any reason or attempt to communicate with Jane from the hallway outside
her room or through the window in her room without the express consent of my client or the staff
at Manatawny Manor. Should Jane wish to go to her room during a visit with her children, she is
free to do so; However, her children may not accompany her to her room or interact with her
while she is in her room. Jane’s room will now serve as a place she can retreat to should she
wish to cut short a meeting with one of her children. If a child enters Jane’s room during a visit,
the staff at Manatawny Manor will be authorized to end the child’s visit and direct the child off
of the property.

3. Jane will not be permitted to have a telephone in her room. Similarly, no one is
permitted to bring a mobile phone to Jane for her use,

4, Jane will not be permitted to receive telephone calls from her children at the
nurses’ station or at any other location at Manatawny Manor using its telephone system. If Jane
wishes to initiate a call from Manatawny Manor to a third party, the staff and Manatawny Manor
will notify my client and she will determine if the staff is to assist Jane in making the call or
make the facility’s telephone system available to Jane.

h The staff at Manatawny Manor will have no obligation to relay messages from
Jane’s children to Jane. They have been directed to use their discretion, subject to their work
assignments, to advise Jane if one of her children is unable to visit or is running late for a visit.
Without my client’s approval, they are not permitted to relay any other messages to Jane from
either of her children.

6. If Jane becomes upset during a visit with one of her children, my client will
determine if future visits with that child are to be conducted in the presence of a third party who
will supervise future visits. The supervisor shall have the authority to report to my client
disruptive and/or upsetting behavior by the child or conduct that violates any of these procedures
or any prior instruction of the Court. If supervised visits become necessary, every effort will be
made to obtain the services of a third party supervisor for visits with Jane’s children. However,
if a supervisor is not available, the visit with the child will be rescheduled to another time when
the supervisor and the child are both available,

7. Consistent with the Court’s earlier orders, Jane’s medical care takes priority over
her visits with her children. If Jane needs to meet with medical personnel for any reason during
a time when one of Jane’s children is permitted to visit her, the child’s visit will be postponed so
as to begin at the conclusion of Jane’s medical treatment. However, if a child interferes in any
way with the care Jane is to receive during the child’s scheduled visit, the child will forfeit the
opporfunity to visit'with Jane for that day and will be escorted off the campus at Manatawny
Manor.

8. Food itemns are not to be brought to Jane without my client’s prior approval.
Requests for approval are to be submitted only via email to pblumer@hotmail.com. Items that
have excessive sugar, sodium and/or fat like lunch meat, mayonnaise, doughnuts, etc. will not be
permitted. If they are discovered in Jane’s room, they will be thrown out regardless of whether

9811860.1
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they were meant for Jane or someone else. Her room is not to be used as a repository for other
people’s food items. Jane’s care plan includes a dietary component, and her children are
expected to follow and support the dietary components on her care plan.

Mr. Meitner and Ms. Camp, I would appreciate you passing on a copy of this letter to
your clients as soon as possible. The procedures listed above are in effect now and your clients
are expected to abide by them effective immediately. My client reserves the right to petition to
the Court to modify its prior orders regarding your clients’ ability to visit with Jane should
concerns about those visits persist. The types of concerns to which I am referring include
without limitation, (1) statements to Jane that she will be leaving Manatawny Manor and
returning to her home, (2) impolite and/or verbally abusive interactions with the staff at
Manatawny Manor (whether in Jane’s presence or otherwise), (3) discussions with Jane about
any legal proceedings involving Jane, her residence and/or her guardianship, (4) statements to
Jane that undermine her confidence in the care she receives at Manatawny Manor and/or (5)
discussions with Jane about any legal proceedings or threatened proceedings involving any of
Jane’s children. Jane has no ability to address or assist with any of the aforementioned topics
and therefore it is completely inappropriate to burden her with these issues.

It is a very simple matter to visit with Jane and not upset her or the staif at Manatawny
Manor. It only takes a mimimal amount of effort and self-control. Those who are unwilling or
unable to exhibit that minimal level of effort and seif-control are injurious to Jane’s well-being
and best interests. My client will seck to bar anyone who is injurious to Jane’s well-being and
best interests from seeing her, contacting her or receiving any information about her.
Consequently, I hope both of Jane’s children will comport themselves appropriately so that it
will not be necessary to seek the termination of their visitation privileges. I thank you all for
your anticipated cooperation with these new procedures, although my client and 1 remain
saddened that they are necessary.

Very truly yours,
William R. Blumer
WRBipek

ce: Pamela W. Blumer, Guardian of the Person
Ronald W. Fenstermacher, Jr., Esq., Guardian of the Estate

S811860.1



Pamela W. Blumer
Professional Fiduciary

Z,

Contact
P.O. Box 2174
Sinking Spring, PA 19608

(610) 401-4567
pblumer@hotmail.com

Key Skills

Excellent oral and written
communication skiils

Highly organized and detail
orienfed

Well versed with the court's GTS
software

Well versed with the DHS
COMPASS portal

Profile

Professional fiduciary providing assistance to older adults and
individuals with intellectual disabilities as a financial agent under
power of attorney, health care agent under medical power of attorney
and as a court-appuinted guardian of the person and estate.

Lxperience

January 1, 2012 - Present

independent professional fiduciary serving Berks County,
Pennsylvania

I am currently serving 20 individuals as either a court-appointed
guardian or agent under power of attorncy. Historically, I serve
between 20 and 30 individuals at any given time. 1 provide
comprehensive oversight and support to individuals living in care
facilities, as well as in their own homes and apartments. Services
include applying for Medical Assistance and other government benefits,
scheduling and attending appointments with physicians and other
healtheare professionals, overseeing the filing of tax returns, daily
money management that includes bill paying and account
reconciliation, making funeral arrangements, help with moving and
regular contact via in person visits and telephone calls. I file all
required reports with the court in a timely, accurate and thorough
manner. 1involve family memhers whenever possible and work
continuously on family reconciliation. I also cultivated an extensive
network of professionals in the community including lawyers, funeral

| directors, nursing home administrators, geriatric care managers, home

health agencies, and government employees so that when my clients
require special help, I can bring in experienced professionals to help
meet my clients’ needs. In short, [ do what is required for the people I
serve to live happy, healthy and fulfilling lives.

January 2010 — December 2011

Guardianship Support Coordinator « Arc Alliance = Reading,
Pennsylvania

1 started as a volunteer for Arc, working for one year in support of its
guardianship progeam. After one year, I was hired by Arcto workina
full-time capacity. Responsibilities included visiting with wards for
whom Are was appointed as guardian, directing the collection of their
monthly income and the payment of their monthly expenses,



overseeing the delivery of healtheare services to wards, filing reports
with the court and maintaining the agency’s records for its
guardianship files.

January 2008 — October 2009
Director of Marketing » Berks Encore » Reading, Pennsylvania

Oversaw the agency’s annual marketing budget and developed
promotional materials, press releases and public presentations to
publicize Berks Encore’s work in the community. Responsibilities
included:
» Coordinated the annual Senior Expo event with approximately
100 vendors and approximately 5,000 attendees.
» Wrote and produced the agency's monthiy news publication,
The Second Wind in coordination with the Reading Eagle.
» Played a leading role in implementing the agency’s annual
community breakfast fundraising event to elevate the agency's
community profile and raise significant operating funds for the

agency.

February 2005 - December 2007

Volunteer Coordinator » Berks Encore + Reading. Pennsylvania
Oversaw the recruitment, training and retention of approximately 1,500
volunteers needed to carry out Berks Encore's Meals on Wheels
pragram. Alse recruited volunteers for the agency’'s income tax
preparation and Apprise insurance counseling services.
Responsibilities included creating detailed meal delivery route
instructions for volunteers that required daily updating as meal
recipients were added to and feft the program. Conducted background
checks on volunteers and obtained all required insurance information
from volunteers. Ran delivery routes when volunteers failed to show
up. Developed and implemented the agency's annual volunteer
recognition event designed to thank and energize the agency's nearly
2,000 volunteers.

Education
May 1989
Bachelor of Arts in English Literature and Psychology,

magna cum laude
Bucknell University, Lewisburg, Pennsylvania




Tuesday, November 8, 2022 at 09:21:44 Eastern Standard Time

Subject: trial next week 3
Date: Monday, November 7, 2022 at 9:50:03 PM Eastern Standard Time ¢
From: tomlinheri925@tutanota.com <tornlinher1925®@tutancta.com>

To: Victor Meitner <vmeitner@AVICTORMEITNERIRPCS85 .onmicrosoft.com>

Mr. Meitner,
As you recall, pam blumer asked me to bring a seat for the shower for my mother about 10 days ago. Mother
does not have one. Since she is the guardian and deb klock is "care manager” | cannot believe pam is asking me to do

their jobs.

ﬁ Today, | saw another Deb wha is a nurse and she and Kay Richardson are in charge of the second floor where my
mather is. | mentioned pam wanted me to get a chair for mother from manatawny manor and Deb made a unhappy
face. It seems she does not like pam or her husband. Deb tokd me when bill asked her to testify a week or so ago she
said no. Then bill subpoenaed her. Deb is mad at them because she sald she will not be paid for the day. She seems to
be mad at pam for ather things, too. Deb told me mother showers standing up and it is standard practice to have a
person watch in case they fall. Deb mentioned she put Colinda and a few other of those wamen at a different
location because of their actions that day about & weeks ago. For the past month, usually no staff person is in the TV
room to watch and iisten to us when we have lunch.

VERY interesting. Deb also told me today on friday they were giving new cavid vaccinations to residents and
wiother really refused to have one. Deb said she did not force it because mother was getting "agitated”. Deb said
mother said she would have to ask me if she should have one. | asiked mother about that today and told her it was
alright. Deb said she will have it scheduled for wednesday when { am there. Deb said mother constantly tatks about
me.

What is very important and should be brought out at the triat is that mother showed how much she depends on
me and trusts me based on fridays statement that mother wants to talk o me first before she gets the vaccinatian,
That will be very important to our argument that mother should be home with me because she trusts me and
believes what | say is the best for her.

1 strongly feel we have to be on the attack with all of them and show how they have done nothing for mother
and been a danger to her and her health and happiness.. Weilheimer will use every bad remark by anybody to cut my
visits and keep mother there. Ledakis only said mother had a littie memory problem, He never said she should be
locked up in a mental ward so far for 13 months, no outside trips anywhere, no doctors visits for 13 months, no
phone in her room and no unlimited visits and time she can be with me. She still does not get any special help from
the staff: dressing, eating, hygiene, bathing, toflet, walking, etc. Mother is getting weaker with her legs when she
walks. That is blumer's fault denying more time for outside walks at the nursing home or other physical and mentai
activities that she would have everyday at home. People (fenstermacher, jaskowiak, weilheimer) last time
were so concerned about mother's savings that they wanted to sefl the house and trash her possessions, but no body
cared that it was costing mother $90,000 a year for a very tiny reom with worn out furniture and locked down in a
mental ward with people with seripus medical, mental and behavior problems that had no benefit o mother when
she could live at home basically free.

Why should mother have to live like that untill she dies in sofitary confinement in a sensory deprived
enviroment? Under blumet's, fenstermacher and jaskowiak's "care”, mother wilt die a crippled person with advanced
dementia and other medical problems because of their lack of proper care way before she should die.

The question that must be asked of blumer, fenstermacher and jaskowiak is after 18 months under their and
logies care, how is mother better off now than BEFORE the petition was filed on May 18 20212 Whether medically,
mentally, physically, emotionally and financially the answer is NONE of those. That shoutd get them fired and mother
home. .
arthur herring lll

Sent with Tutanota, enjoy secure & ad-free emails.

Pagelofl



%,

2/7123, 7:05 PM fomiinher1825@tutanota.com - Tutanota

meet

tomilinher1925@tutanota.com »

to: tomlinher1925@tutanctacom + 17 Fri, Jul 20, 2022 - 23:00
Ms. Plumer,

| want to setup a meeting with you ASAP at my mother's house for you to see how she has

lived and also to discuss various other matters pertaining to my mother.
| visit my mother Monday, Wednesday and Friday 11-12noon. My phone is 215.960.4447.

Arthur Herring ili

Sent with Tutanota, enjoy secure & ad-free emails.

htIps:Hmaii‘tutanota.wnfmaiuNBCZCuv—?—ZlNaczsjymz
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BARLEY SNYDER, LLP ’ 5:-

Thad M. Gelsinger, Esquirc

Attorney LD, No. 208233 )

Latisha Bernard Schuenemann, Faquire

Attoreey LD. No. 204874

Witliam R. Blymer, Esquire

Attorney LD, No. 59853

2755 Century Boulevard

Wyomissing, PA 19610

(6107 372-3500 ' -
Astorneys for Pamela Woodward Blumer, Guardian of the Person, Jane T. Herring, an Incapacitated Person

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS OF MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA
ORPHANS’ COURT DIVISION

IN RE: JANE T, HERRING, ' : ‘
AN INCAPACITATED PERSON i . FILE NO, 2021-X2110

*
—

CONSENT AND JOINDER OF GUARDIAN OF THE PERSON TO THE
PRELIMINARY OBJECTIONS TO EMERGENCY PETITION
FILED BY ARTHUR BERRING, IIL, ON OCTOBER 19, 2023 )
TO FROVE IF ARTHUR HERRING I IS A DANGER OR MENACE TO JANE
HERRING AS HE HAS BEEN ACCUSED OF BEING DURING THIS SCAM
GUARDIANSHIP '

NOW COMES, Pamela Woodward Blumer, Guardian of the Person of Jane T Herring, an
Incapacitated Perst;n (“Ms. Blumer”) by and through her counsel files this Consent and Joinder to
the Preliminary Objections filed by David A. Jaskowiak Esquire to Arthur Herring’s “Emergency "
Motion” to Prove:if Arﬂau:iening isa Dang_c_l; or Menace to Jage Herring %&M

Accused of Being During This Scam Guardianship and in furtherance thereof avers as. follows:

1. The Objector is the court-appointed Guardian of the Person for Jane T. Herring, @i
incapacitated person (“Jane”).

2. On October 19, 2023, Jane’s son, Arthur Herring, ITI (“Arthur’) filed four (4)
“Emergency Motions” seeking various relief from this Court on the basis of allegations that have
already been heard and ruled upon by the Court. ‘

£1142116.1




cm#mzlmﬁaaauﬂmmmmmanmrymmgmrwmm on 11082023 10:18 AM, Fee = 50.00. The fer cortifies thal this ling complies with the provisions of the Pubiic Access

3
E 3. On October 25, 2023, this Court entered an Order ruling that “No emergency e:dsts_s
at this time and that this matter will [be] handled in due course.” |
4,  OnNovember 6, 2023, David A. Jaskowiak, Esquire (“Mr. Jaskowiak™), Jane’s
E court-appointed eounsel filed Preliminary Objections to each of Arthur’s “Emergency Motions™. .
E 5. Ms. Blumer consents and joins in the Preliminary Objections filed by
g Mr. Jaskowiak and requests that this Court enter the Proposed Order accompanying that filing,
' WHEREFORE, Pamela Woodward Blumer, Guardian of the Person of Jane T, Herring, ~
E an Incapacitated Person, respectfully requests that the Court sustain the Preliminary Objections
to Arthur Herring’s Emergency Petition and that the Emergency Petition be stricken mits
t -
% entirety.
g Date: November 8, 2023 Respectfully submitted,
g BARLEY SNYDER, LLP
2 ‘By: /s/ Thad M. Gelsinger
3 Thad M. Gelsinger, Esquire
2 Atiomey LD. No. 208233
g Latisha Bernard Schuenemann, Esquire
Attorney 1.D. No. 204574
& William R. Blumer, Esquire
H Attorney LD. No. 59853
E 2755 Century Boulevard
Wyomissing, PA 19610
§ (610Y372-3500
% Attorneys for Pamela Woodward Blumer,
E Permanent Plenary Guardian of the Person,
a Jane T. Herring, an Incapacitated Person
£
5
!
3
g
1
.B ' 1 2
142116
1
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_Barley Snyder
Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 invoice No. 70461843
Date Isit _ Description of Services Rendered Howrs Amount
4/11/23 WRB Meeting with Mr. Gelsinger to discuss conference with counsel and the 300 13350
judge and the proposal 10 have Mr. Herring undergo 2 psychological

cvaluation

411723 TMG  Call with Attomey Jaskowiak; emails with Court regarding Judge requesting 60 237.00
zoom conference; review Arthur Herring's email to Judge's staff

41121 ™G Zoom conlerence with Court and counsel regarding suggesting Arthur 60 237.00
Herring undergo a psych evaluation

41123 T™MG  Email to Mrs. Blumer regarding update on calt with the Judge 30 118350

4/11/23 ™G Email 1o Detective Kelly per Judge's instructions .20 79.00

41723 TMG  Follow up call with Mrs. Blumer regarding status of discussions with Judge 20 276.%0

41223 TMG  Review Court's order on neuropsych evaluation for Asthur Herring : email 20 79.00
same {0 Mrs. Blumer

4/12/23 SMB  Review of Order regarding neuropsychological evaluation of Arthur .20 43.00
Herring; work on file regarding deadline to notify Court with regard to
evaluation

4/14/23 TMG Emails with Mrs. Blumer reganding status of Judge's request for Anhur 20 79.00
Herring to undergo neurospych evaluation

417723 T™MG  Emails with Mrs. Blumer regarding cards received by Manatawny Manor for 20 79.00
Jane Herring

4/1&/23 WRB Merting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss report from Jill Herring that Mrs. S0 222.50

Herring is upset Jill isn't supportive enough of Arthur Herring's alleged
religious ministry for women and the implication that Mrs. Herring actuaity
remembers more abows Arthur Herring's visits than expected and how that
would impact the guandian's exercise of discretion to permit visitation with

Arthur Herring
4/19723 TMG Review Vic/Arthur's email regarding rejecting neurospeyh evaluation 40 15800
420723 TMG  Email update to Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring rejecting neurospych 20 79.00
evaluation ‘
420023 TMG Review status of outstanding Appeals 40 158.00
420v23 TMG  Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding update on case with Vic withdrawing 60 237.00
4/20723 LBS Meeting with Thad Gelsinger regarding appeals; mecting with Mr, Blumer A0 156.00

regarding additional fec petition

_



R/

K s cuardianship.org/tind-a- guss diany

o, | HOME ABOUTUS »

FIND A GUARDIAN

blumer

Search By State

Y

Pamela Blumer, NCG

Organization: P.Blumer
Address: PO Box 21?4
City/State/Zip: Sinking Spring. PA 19608
Phone: 6104014567
Fax:

Email: ohiumer@hotmailoom

. L3 g e e om : . n
Webhsite: 107 Atientic dvernue



SYRIEAY BUUELY SOT IDUSGIM

Wi IO i M \Q Jewy
_ | xmu_ .
mwmvwo_voww “_u_..tonm
80961 Vd ‘Butids Suptus diz/areIs/MD
N PL1ZX080d SSRPPY

iswinig ¢4 :uopeziuedi

13Winjg ejauwied

21815 Ag cﬁmmm ,

tswinyg ..

SNLNody 3WOH




@,

Pamela Blumer IWVOICE
P.O.Box 2174
Sinking Spring, PA 19608 ‘ Invoice # 1713
TO: FOR:
Jane Herring Guardianship Services
July
Date . Description
Phone consult with counsel regarding response to
715123 the Court regarding visitation. 0.50
Phone consult with counsel regarding response to
7110/23 Arthur's petition. 0.25
7111123 Signed verification.
Phone call with counsel regarding where we are at
with all the petitions that have been filed to be sure
7112123 that no responses have heen overlooked. 0.25
7121123 Visited with Jane. 2.00
Phone call with counsei regarding the Court's
7f25/23 orders and their implications. 0.50

E; Received a call from Manatawny Manor stating that
they have 41 cases of Covid. They are all on the 1st
floor. There are no cases on Jane's floor, and Jane

7131123 is doing fine.

Total Hours 3.50
Hourly Rate 125.00
Total Owed: 437.50 -

Please make all checks payable to: Pamela Blumer
Total due in 15 days. Overdue accounts subject to a service charge of 1% per month.

Thank You



Pamela Blumer CRTEN g
P.O.Box 2174

i, g

Sinking Spring, PA 19608 A Invoice# 1714

TO:! | FOR:

Jane Herring Guardianship Services
August

Date. . - .- Description

8/1123 Phone call with counsel regarding Arthur's petition. 0.50

Received a call from Jen Costeito from the Chester
County Department of Aging, following upon a
complaint made by Arthur, Specifically, she was
questioning the reasoning behind Arthur having to
pay the supervisor who is supervising his visits with
his mother. | explained the timeline of events and
informed her that there are court orders
documenting ail of this. She was unaware of the

8/8/23 court orders. 0.50
Discussed with counsel the cail from the Office of

8/8/23 Aging. 0.25
Phone call with counse! to update all of the current

819123 petitions and orders. 0.25

8/18/23 Visited with Jane. 2.00

Phone call with counse! to discuss the possibility of
Arthur visiting on Labor Day .... ltneeds to be

8122123 rescheduled for Wednesday, if he wants to come. 0.25
Received a call from counsel to with an update on

8/29/23 the zoom conference with the judge. 0.25

Total Hours 4.00
Hourly Rate 125.00

Total Owed: 500:00 -



Pamela Blumer YOI E
P.O.Box 2174

Sinking Spring, PA 19608 A Invoice # 1715

TO:! | FOR:

Jane Herring Guardianship Services
Manatawny Manor September

30 Old Schuylkill Road
Pottsfown, PA 18465

Date . Description S | " Hours

9/15/23 Visited with Jane. 2.00
Phone call with counsel to discuss upcoming review

9/19/23 hearing. 0.25
Phone call with counsel regarding the upcoming

9/25/23 hearing next week. 0.50
Phone cali with counsel regarding the possible

8/26/23 reassignment of Judge Weilheimer. 0.25

Total Hours 3.00
Houtly Rate 125.00
Total Owed: 375.00

Please make all checks payabie to: Pamela Blumer
Total due in 15 days. Overdue accounts subject 1o a service charge of 1% per month.

Thank You



Pamela Blumer MY hoE
P.O.Box 2174

Sinking Spring, PA 19608 ‘ invoice # 1716

TO: FOR;:

Jane Herring Guardianship Services
Manatawny Manar October

30 Old Schuylkill Road
Pottstown, PA 19465

Date  Description

10/2/23 Phone call with counsel to prep for hearing. 0.25

Discussed with counsel Mr. Fenstermacher's
concern that there is no order specifically allowing
me to enter Jane's house and retrigsve her clothing
and some personal items for her use at Manatawny
Manor. Decided the bestway to accomplish this
10/3/23 was a stipulated order, 0.50

Attended court hearing on Arthur's petition for
unlimited/unsupervised visits with Jane. The judge
made no changes to the existing order of visitation

10/4/23 at this time. 4.00
Phone cail with counsel regarding emails from
Arthur, the outcome and implicatioms of the hearing,

10/5/23 and Arthur's upcoming visit(s). 0.75

Visited with Jane. Had a very nice visit. We stayed
in the social room. Jane did notwant to participate

¥

in the activities, but she enjoyed being on the

10/10/23 periphery. 2.00
Phone call with counsel regarding emails from

10/16/23 Arthur. 0.25
Phone call with counsel regarding more emaits from

10/17/23 Arthur. 0.25
Phone call with counsel regarding Arthur's visit

10/19/23 yesterday. 0.50

Phone call with counsel regarding more emails from
10/30/23 Arthur. 0.50




Total Hours 9.00
Hourly Rate 125.00
Total Owed; 1125.00.

Please make all cﬁecks payable to: Pamela Blumer
Total due in 15 days. Overdue accounts subject to a service charge of 1% per month.

Thank You




Pamela Blumer : INVOICE
P.O.Box 2174

Sinking Spring, PA 19608 , invoice # 19

T0: FOR:

Jane Hetring Guardianship Services
Manatawny Manor November

30 Oid Schuylkili Road

Pottsiown, PA 19485

Received a call from Debbie stating that Arthur has

arrived approximately 45 ninutes sarly for his visit.

He would also like to put the ice cream somewhere

so that it doesntmelt. Staff will put the ice cream in

the freeezer. Spoke with Mary Ellen o make sure
matshewasawareﬁmmrm#meand

waiting to see Jane. Confacted counsei to aprise

111123 him of Arthur's early arrival. 050

Received a cail from Debbie stating that Jane has
bean sent to the hospital iollowing a fall that she
had in the hallway. Her vital signs are fine, but she
did hit her head and they would like to have her
1113123 checked out. 0.25

Calied the ER 10 check on Jane. She has already
been discharged back 1o Manatawney Manor, as all
1313 of the scans are negative for any fractures or injury.. 0.25

Calied Manatawny Manor to check on Jane. She is
1113123 doing fine. 025

Contacied counsel to ask him o notify Arthur of his
mother's fall, given that she still has some bruising
1113/23 and he will be visiting her this week. 025

Contacted counsel regarding Arthur’s visit with his
1115/23 mother. 0.25



11720123

11727123

1112823

11130723

Contacted counsel regarding Arthur's emails. 025

© Contacted counsei regarding my Petiton to

Withdraw. 025

Contacted Latisha Schuenemann regarding
changes 1o Petition. 0.25

Visited with Jane, Her bruising is almost healed.

She wenl to the hairdresser this morning and was in

an exceptionally good mood. Eating lunch when |

arrived. ' 200
Total Hours 4.50

Hourly Rate 125.00

Please make ail checks paysbie to. Pamela Bumer
Total due in 15 days. Overdue accounts subject to a service charge of 1% per month.

Thank You



9.

Barley Snyder
Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 , Invoice No. 70461843

RE: Herring, Jane T. - Guardianship
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

i Hu Amount

__Date_Init __Description
6/15/22 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss representing her in connection with the S50 207.50
Jane Herring guardianship and upcoming hearing

6/15/22 WRB Meeting to discuss strategies for curtailing cereal objections for Arthur S0 207.50
Herring regarding his mother's care that are unsubstantiated and designed
solely to prolong litigation

6/16/22 LBS  Prepare entry of appearance and certificate of service; letter to all regarding S0 175.00
entry of appearance

6/20/22 LBS  Electronically file entry of appearance 20 70.00

6/21/22 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss Arthur Herring's refusal to allow his 60 249.00

mother to be x-rayed during his visitation time, telephone conference with
Attorney Jaskowiak regarding proposal to request a conference with the
judge to modify Arthur Herring's visitation schedule and request supervised
visitation

6/22/22 LBS  Meeting with Mr. Blumer regarding limiting visitation; review docket and .80 280.00
obtain prior court orders

6/24/22 1BS Research allowance petitions; email Mrs. Blumer regarding petition for 40 140.00
allowance

6/27/22 WRB Meeting with Guardian of the Person to discuss possible modifications of S50 20750
visitation order in light of Jane Herring's historic agitation when her son
does not visit her regularly

7/05/22 WRB Review email from Mr. Meitner requesting more time for his client to visit 90  391.50
with Mrs. Herring, meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss her concerns about
Mr. Meitner's request and need to petition the court to modify its prior
visitation order, reply to Mr. Meitner's email advising him of his client's
counterproductive behavior to date

7/06/22 WRB Reply to email regarding available dates for court hearing, review report by S50 217.50
Dr. Ledakis

7/20/22 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to confirm her position on issues likely to arise S50 217.50
during the upcoming status conference with the court

7/20/22 WRB Reread Dr. Ledakis' report and prepare for status conference S50 217.50




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843

' Iit ri f rvices Rendered | ount

7/20/22 WRB Attend status conference, draft leiter to counsel announcing new visitation 1.90 826.50
rules, email draft letter to counsel to Mrs. Blumer for her review and
comment, review email from Attorney Jaskowiak and attached letter of
4/20/22 from Mrs. Herring to the court

7/20/22 WRB Telephone conference with Mrs. Blumer to discuss the status conference, the S0 217.50
proposed changes to the children's visitation and the rationale for not
moving Mrs. Herring to a personal care facility in lieu of having her remain
at Manatawny Manor

7/25/22 WRB Review and reply to email from Mr. Meitner regarding his client's concerns 40 174.00
about the new visitation restrictions imposed by Mrs. Blumer

7/27/22 WRB Review and reply to emails from counsel regarding proposal to transfer 20 87.00
residence into a trust for Arthur Herring and make an equalizing cash gift to
Jill Herring

7/29/22 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to prepare for video conference with Arthur 40 174.00
Herring and Victor Meitner

7/29/22 WRB Telephone conference with Mrs. Blumer, Victor Meitner and Arthur Herring 90 391.50
to discuss concerns about Jane Herring's care at Manatawny Manor

8/01/22 WRB Telephone conference with Attorney Jaskowiak to discuss Arthur Herring's 60 261.00
response to the changed visitation rules for Jane Herring and to discuss
concerns about paying for Mrs. Herring's care for the balance of her life if
she engages in lifetime asset transfers

8/04/22 WRB Attend status conference regarding outstanding petition for eviction 80 348.00

8/05/22 WRB Reply to email from Victor Meitner 20 87.00

8/08/22 WRB Brief meeting to discuss Jill Herring's concemns about visitation restrictions 30 13050

8/24/22 LBS  Obtain contempt motion and eviction motion 20 74.00

8/25/22 WRB Review petitions to be considered at upcoming hearing in October, email to S50 217.50
counse] to determine need for Mrs. Blumer to participate in the hearing

9/01/22 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss (1) email from Victor Meitner (2) 100 435.00

recent reports from the nursing home staff about Mr. Herring's recent visits
and (3) adding supplemental care to address possible need for more exercise
and mental stimulation for Mrs. Herring; assist Mrs. Blumer with writing her
response to Victor Meitner's request for additional visitation time for his
client and private visits




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 | July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 , Invoice No. 70461843
77777 Date Init ripﬁon of Services Rendered "~ Hours Amount
9/02/22 WRB Telephone conference with Mrs. Blumer to discuss disruption at nursing 1.00  435.00

home caused by Arthur Herring attempting to record residents in violation of
the facility's privacy policy, telephone conference with Victor Meitner to
seek his assistance in controlling his client and discussing the restrictions on
Arthur Herring's visitation privileges

9/02/22 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss the phone call with Mr. Meitner and S50 217.50
the possibility of filing a petition with the court to further restrict Arthur
Herring's access to Mrs. Herring

9/02/22 WRB Review email from Mr. Meitner explaining that Arthur Herring did nothing 20 87.00
wrong and had no part in instigating a profanity laced exchange by one of
the Manatawny Manor staff

9/10/22 WRB Review email from guardian of the estate commenting on options for Arthur S50 217.50

Herring's living arrangements and meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss
likely impact of supporting Mr. Herring financially and Jane Herring's likely

cost of care -

9/12/22 WRB Email to Mr. Meitner regarding upcoming lunch meeting with Mr. Herring 20 87.00
and him

9/12/22 WRB Review prior court orders in preparation for meeting with Mr. Meitner and S50 217.50
Arthur Herring

9/12/22 LBS Review court orders with Mr. Blumer (NO CHARGE) 30 00

9/13/22 WRB Attend meeting with Mrs. Blumer, Mr. Meitner and Mr. Herring to discuss 3.70  1,609.50

their concems about Mrs. Herring's care and the desire to relax visitation
restrictions and move Mrs. Herring to a different care setting

9/14/22 WRB Review lengthy emails to Mrs. Blumer from Mr. Meitner and Arthur 1.30 565.50
Herring, meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss which doctors Mrs, Herring
needs to see and advisability of petitioning the court to limit Mr. Herring's
visitation, ending his ability to bring focd to Mrs. Herring and starting an
aide to monitor Mr. Herring's visits with his mother and providing Mrs.
Herring with exercise and mental stimulation, draft email to Mr. Meitner
advising him of changes fo visitations by Mr. Herring and forthcoming
petition to limit Mr. Herring's visits with Mrs. Herring

9/16/22 WRB Complete email to Victor Meitner forwarding email from his client and .60  261.00
advising him of the new aide's visitation schedule and upcoming petition to
limit visits by Mr. Herring




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843

Date Init _Description of Services Rendered _

9/17/22 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to finalize strategy for advising Arthur Herring S50 217.50
about changes to his visitation with his mother

9/19/22 WRB Draft letter to Manatawny Manor informing staff that an aide will be 50 217.50
assisting Ms. Herring

9/19/22 WRB Revise draft emergency petition to restrict visitation by Arthur Herring 3.00 1,305.00

9/20/22 WRB Complete Mrs. Blumer's revisions to the emergency petition to limit Mr. 40  174.00
Herring's visits

9/20/22 LBS Finalize petition and exhibits for filing; letter to all regarding service of .20  444.00

notice to plead and petition; prepare notice to plead and certificate of
service; electronically file petition

9/28/22 WRB Review emergency petition filed by Arthur Herring seeking continuance and 1.70 73950
authority to subpoena witnesses and documents, begin drafting response to
emergency motion, Telephone conference with Mrs. Blumer regarding filing
of emergency petition, review court order dismissing petition

9/28/22 LBS Meeting with Mr. Blumer to review emergency motion for continuance of 30 111.00
hearing
9/29/22 WRB Review emails from Brittney Camp and Attorney Jaskowiak 20 87.00

9/29/22 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to prepare her for her testimony at the October 3, 130  565.50
2022 hearing and discuss the need for testimony from staff at Manatawny
Manor

1/03/23 WRB Meeting with Mr. Gelsinger to discuss the upcoming 60 day anniversary of S50 222.50
the stipulated agreement on visitation and to assess whether Mr. Herring's
visits with his mother afford her any benefit or create material harm o her

1/03/23 TMG Review status of visitation arrangement with Mr. Blumer 50 19750

1/04/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding strategy following 60 days of supervised 90  355.50
visits

1/05/23 SMB Review numerous notifications from Superior Court and Orphan's Court; 150 32250

review file and various Court filings; preparation of email to Mr. Gelsinger
regarding same; work on file regarding deadline for Docketing Statement
and Concise Statements of Matters Complained of on Appeal

1/06/23 TMG Review status of appeals; email to Mrs. Blumer regarding Ledakis opining 20 79.00
on value of Arthur Herring's visits with Jane Herring
1/06/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding update, asking judge to relist petition S0 19750




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843
‘Date Init _ Description of Services __Hours _Amount_

1/06/23 SMB Telephone conference with Mr. Gelsinger regarding status of case (NO 20 00
CHARGE)

1/09/23 SMB Review of Request for Transcript (Order dated 10/7/22) 20 43.00

1/10/23 TMG Review Concise Statement of Matters Complained of regarding eviction 60 237.00
order; review appellate procedure regarding same

1/10/23 TMG Review Judge's Order on visitation; email with Mrs. Blumer regarding same 40  158.00

1/10/23 TMG Call with Attorney Jaskowiak; draft letter to Judge regarding petition to limit S50 197.50
visits

1/10/23 SMB Review of Concise Statement of Matters Complained of on Appeal (Order 20 43.00
dated 10/7/22)

1/11/23 TMG Review additional concise statements of matters complained on appeal 30 118.50

1/11223 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding update; review/revise letter to Judge 60 237.00
regarding visitation

1/11/23 TMG Review updated notes from visitation supervisor 20 79.00

1/11/23 TMG Review Petition to Strike Arthur Herring's Appeals due to his concise .20 79.00
statement of matters complained of on appeal

1/11/23 SMB Review of Concise Statement of Matters Complained of on Appeal (Order .30 64.50
dated 11/10/22); review of Concise Statement of Matters Complained of on
Appeal (Order dated 11/10/22); review of Concise Statement of Matters
Complained of on Appeal (second Order dated 11/10/22)

1/12/23 TMG Emails regarding request on Petition for Restriction of Visits by Mr. Herring 30 118.50

1/12/23 SMB Review of correspondence to Judge Weilheimer; review of Motion to Strike 30 64.50
Concise Statement of Matters Complained of on Appeal

1/12/23 SMB Review of Request for Transcripts (two 11/14/22 Orders); review of Request 30 64.50
for Transcript (Order dated 11/10/22)

1/17/23 TMG Emails with Mrs. Blumer regarding check/Arthur Herring leaving the unit; S0 197.50
email to Victor Meitner regarding same; review additional supervised visit
notes

1/17/23 TMG Review portion of transcript of contempt proceedings .60  237.00

00

1/17/23

Review of Notes of Testimony (NO CHARGE)




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ' July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843

_Date Init _ Description of Services Rendered __Hours Amount_
1/18/23 TMG  Calls with Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring not allowing Brandy in the 70 276.50
room; email to Atty Meitner regarding same

1/19/23 TMG Review Notice of Appeal of 2nd Contempt Order 20 79.00

1/19/23 TMG Review Order scheduling hearing on visitation; email to Mrs. Blumer 30 118.50
regarding same '

1/19/23 LBS Review appeal | 20 7800

1/19/23 SMB  Review of Notice of Appeal - Order dated 12/21/22; check Superior Court .30 64.50
docket

1/20/23 WRB Discussions with co-counsel and Mts. Blumer about how to respond to email 40 178.00
indicating no money to pay for visitations and proposing to return to
unsupervised visits

172023 WRB Reply to email from Attorney Fenstamacher agreeing to pay supervisor and 40 178.00
withhold the cost from gifts to Arthur Herring

1720/23 TMG Emails regarding Victor Meitner's position that Arthur Herring cannot pay J0 o 276.50
for visits so back to unsupervised visits; call with Mrs. Blumer regarding
same

1120723 TMG Begin to review for testimony at February 3 hearing; additional emails with 1.60  632.00
Victor Meitner regarding visitation

1/2023 LBS  Email Thad and Mr. Blumer regarding unsupervised visits 20 78.00
1/20/23 SMB  Review of Order regarding visitation agreement; review of file (NO 20 00
CHARGE)

1/23/23 TMG Emails with Victor Meitner advising we do expect Brandy to testify; Brandy 1.60  632.00
will be at Manatawny Manor in case Arthur Herring visits; Calls with Mrs.
Blumer regarding Arthur Herring's MV A, late visit; emails to Victor Meitner

regarding same
1/23/23 TMG Review court orders, continue review for hearing 1.00  395.00
1724/23 TMG Review Dr. Ledakis report regarding potentially testifying at hearing 260 1,027.00
1/24/23 TMG Prepare notes for questions to raise with visit supervisor; begin to note for 2.60 1,027.00
Dr. Ledakis
1/24/23 TMG Ema.ils with Mrs. Blumer regarding Dr. Ledakis' testimony for upcoming 30 118.50
earing




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 _ Invoice No. 70461843

Date Init _ Description of Services Rendered
1/24/23 SMB Review of Order regarding compliance with Docketing Statement; review of 30 64.50
correspondence to Mr. Meitner; work on file regarding revised deadline for

Docketing Statement

1/2523 TMG Continue review of Ledakis reports for testimony; call to Dr. Ledakis office 80  316.00
regarding hearing; review additional notes from Brandy

172523 TMG Email/call with Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring's current visit and .60 237.00
records to produce to Mr. Meitner

1/25/23 TMG Call with Dr. Ledakis regarding hearing 30 118.50

1/25/23 SMB Review of Order granting Petition for Allowance of attorneys fees and .20 00
expenses to Attorney Jaskowiak (NO CHARGE)

1/26/23 TMG Continue to prepare for hearing; organize exhibits, prepare potential cross 1.00  395.00
for Mr. Herring

1/27/23 WRB Meeting with Mr. Gelsinger to prepare for hearing to consider changes to .80  356.00
visitation schedule for Arthur Herring

1/27/23 TMG Call with Dr. Ledakis to confirm he'll be available for hearing on 2/3 20 79.00

1/27/23 TMG Review with Mr. Blumer regarding issues in case, upcoming hearing; review 1.06  395.00
additional issues for hearing

1/30/23 TMG Review updated supervisor notes; emails with Mrs. Blumer, Attorney 30 11850
Jaskowiak regarding visits

1/31/23 WRB Meeting with Mrs, Blumer to discuss contact by the Fort Washington FBI S0 222.50
office investigating allegations of misconduct made by Arthur Herring

1/31/23 TMG Adjust Brandy hearing notes due to recent visit notes; email to Victor 40  158.00
Meitner regarding notes

1/31/23 TMG FEmails with Court staff and Mrs. Blumer regarding moving hearing; call to 20 79.00
Dr. Ledakis regarding same

1/31/23 TMG Call and emails with Mrs, Blumer regarding FBI involvement; cail with 1.00  395.00
Brandy regarding hearing

1/31/23 LBS  Meeting with Mr. Blumer regarding FBI investigation 20 78.00

2/01/23 TMG Emails with Court/Mr. Meitner/Mrs. Blumer regarding remote testimony; 30 11850
review Arthur Herring's response to Motion to Strike Concise Statement

2/01/23 SMB Review of Arthur Herring's Response to Motion to Strike Concise 20 43.00

Statements of Matters Complained of on Appeal




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Inveoice No. 70461843
Date Init _ Description of Services Rendered . _Amount
2/02/23 WRB Meeting to discuss possible withdrawal of Mrs. Blumer as guardian of the S50 222,50
estate
2/02/23 TMG Review status of Mrs. Blumer's ongoing role 50 197.50
2/02/23 LBS  Meeting with Mr. Blumer and Thad Gelsinger regarding resignation of 100 390.00

guardian; letter to all parties in interest regarding service of petition for
allowance; finalize petition and exhibits; electronically file petition for
allowance

2/02/23 SMB Review of Petition for Allowance of Atiorneys' Fees and Guardian's Fees; 20 .00
' work on file regarding receipt of response from Court regarding Petition
(NO CHARGE)

2/06/23 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer fo discuss information about FBI investigation S0 22250
into allegations of public corruption

2/06/23 WRB Review GoFundMe page set up by Arthur Herring and file report with the 1.00  445.00
website seeking to have the page taken down for making false and
defamatory statements that threatened to reveal private information about
Mrs. Herring to the publie for Mr. Herring's personal financial benefit

2/06/23 TMG Review Arthur Herring's GoFundMe page; emails with Mrs. Blumer 60 237.00
regarding same; telephone conference with with Attorney Jaskowiak
regarding hearing
2/06/23 TMG Review updated notes from Arthur Herring's visit; emails with Mrs. Blumer 0 276.50
regarding hearing
2/06/23 LBS Meeting with Mr. Blumer regarding possible resignation of Mrs. Blumer as 1.00  390.00
guardian
2/06/23 SMB Check docket regarding Docketing Statement 20 43,00
2/07/23 WRB Telephone conference with potential successor guardian of the person .20  534.00
2/0723 WRB Review latest petition filed by Arthur Herring ahead of upcoming hearing 30 13350
2/07/23 TMG Review Superior Court's letter to Judge; revise/revise notes for Mrs. 1.50 59250
Blumer's testimony at hearing; review 2/7/23 Motion to Recuse and for Jane
Herring to testify
2/07/23 SMB Review of Superior Court letter to Judge Weilheimer (NO CHARGE) 20 00
2/08/23 TMG Continue to review/prep for hearing; meeting with Mrs. Blumer regarding 6.50 2,567.50




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ' July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 invoice No. 70461843
Init  Description of Services Rendered "Hours _Amount_
2/08/23 SMB Review of Petition to Allow Jane Herring to Appear at hearing and Recusal 30 64.50
of Judge Weilheimer; review of Notes of Testimony
2/09/23 TMG Review and attend first day hearing on Petition to Limit Visits 570 2,251.50
2/09/23 TMG Review Notice to Attend from Attorney Jaskowiak to Arthur Herring 20 79.00
2/09/23 SMB Review of Order scheduling bifurcated hearing 20 43.00
2/10/23 TMG Review notes for testimony for Mrs. Blumer/Dr. Ledakis following Brandy's 200 790.00
testimony
2/10/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding follow up on hearing 90  355.50
2/13/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding additional thoughts on hearing 30 118.50
2/14/23 WRB Draft revised proposed order for visitation, email revised order to Mr. 120 534.00

Gelsinger for review, meeting to discuss status of various appeals by Arthur
Herring and which appeals require a response by the guardian of the person
and which deal with the guardian of the estate only

2/14/23 TMG 2nd Day hearing on Petition to Limit Visitation 350 2,172.5¢
2/14/23 LBS Telephone conference with Mr. Blumer regarding appeals (NO CHARGE) .30 00
2/14/23 SMB Review of Opinicn; check Superior Court docket regarding filing; 30 64.50
preparation of email to Mr. Gelsinger regarding same
2/15/23 TMG Review/revise proposed amended order .20 79.00
2/15/23 TMG Attend 3rd day of hearing on petition to limit visitation 3.50 1,382.50
2/15/23 LBS  Review docket and outline notice of appeals and status of each appeal B0 312.00
2/16/23 WRB Review court order modifying Arthur Herring's visits and email copy of the 20 89.00

order to Mrs. Blumer questioning language permitting Mr. Herring to bring
food to visits without her approval

2/16/23 WRB Meeting to review appellate docket and discuss how to respond to Arthur S50 22250
Herring's refusal to visit his mother

2/16/23 TMG Emails regarding Court's Order on food for Jane Herring; review Order as 30 11850
filed

2/16/23 TMG Telephone calls with Mrs. Blumer regarding status, payment procedure for 70 276.50
visits; emails with Victor Meitner regarding same

2/16/23 LBS Review appeals with Mr. Blumer (NO CHARGE) 20 00

10



Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843

_Date Init __Description of Services Rendered Hours _Amount

2/17/23 SMB Review of Amended Order granting Emergency Petition to Modify Custody; 30 64.50
review of Order dismissing Appeal

221123 TMG  Review notes from Brandy staying with Jane Herring; emails with Mrs. 30 118.50

Blumer regarding notes
2/22/23 WRB Review various emails from counsel, including Mr. Meitner's proposal to 30 133.50

resolve all issues in dispute and withdraw Superior Court appeals

2/22/23 TMG Emails with counsel/guardians regarding appellate filings; review objections 40 158.00
of Arthur Herring to petition for allowance of appeal

2/22/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding status of appeal 30 11850

2/22/23 TMG Emails with Victor Meitner regarding his proposal to resolve outstanding 30 118.50
matters; email tc Mrs. Blumer regarding same
2/22/23 SMB Review of Objections of Arthur Herring to Petition for Allowance of 30 64.50

Attorneys’ Fees and Guardian's Fees; review of Appellant's Motion to
Reconsider Order filed F ebruary 17, 2023

2/23/23 TMG Telephone call with Mrs, Blumer regarding Victor Meitner's settlement 30 118.50
overtures, emails
2/24/23 TMG Email to Court questioning if the J udge wants notes for visits when Arthur S0 197.50

Herring does not attend; review Brandy's recent notes; emails with Mrs.
Blumer regarding food guidance for Arthur Herring

2/24/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding recent issues related to Arthur 80  316.00
Herring/Victor Meitner's emails

2/24/23 SMB  Review of Order granting Motion for Reconsideration; review of 20 43.00
correspondence from Superior Court; work on file regarding deadline for
docketing statement

2/27/23 TMG Emails with Victor Meitner/Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring's 20 79.00

continued request to bring food/lunch
2/277123 TMG Telephone call with Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring's visit today with 30 118.50

Jane Herring
2/28/23 TMG Emails regarding Arthur Herring moving his visit from Wednesday to Friday 20 79.00
3/01/23 TMG Email to Mrs. Blumer confirming Arthur Herring visit for Friday; review 20 79.00
Docketing Statement
3/01/23 SMB Review of Docketing Statement (NO CHARGE) 20 .00

H




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ' July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843

_ Date Init __Description of Services Rendered L ~_ Hours Amount

3/02/23 SMB Review of Order authorizing payment to Brandywine Neurology Associates 20 .00
(NO CHARGE)

3/03/23 TMG Emails with Mrs. Blumer regarding status, Brandy's notes; review Brandy's 30 118.50
notes from this week; email notes to the Court

3/06/23 TMG Emails with Mrs. Blumer and Victor Meitner regarding not receiving check .60 237.00
for Arthur Herring's visit; call with Mrs. Blumer regarding same

3/08/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding Brandy visit; email to Victor Meitner 40 158.00
regarding photos Arthur Herring took of Brandy; review Court's 3/8/23
Opinion

3/08/23 TMG Emails regarding Brandy no Jonger able to supervise at usual times, need to .20 79.00
move to 5:30-6:30 p.m.

3/08/23 SMB Review of Judge Weilheimer's Opinion regarding Orders dated November 20 .00
10, 2022 and November 14, 2022 (NO CHARGE)

3/09/23 WRB Review opinion by Judge Weilheimer and scheduling order from the 30 133.50
Superior Court

3/09/23 TMG Emails with Victor Meitner regarding Arthur Herring's visit; Call with Mrs. A0 158.00

‘ Blumer regarding Manatawny Manor asking for Arthur Herring's visits to be

in reception area

3/09/23 TMG Review weekly supervisor notes; email same to Court; review appellate 30 11850
court filings

3/09/23 SMB Review of Certificate for transcript of record sent to Superior Court; review 60 129.00

of Transcripts of Testimony, Trial Court Opinion, Trial Exhibits and
Original Record filed in Superior Court; review of Appellant Brizfing
Schedule; work on file regarding due date for Appellant's Brief

3/10/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding status of Manatawny Manor request for S50 197.50
Arthur Herring not to come onto Memory Care unit; email to Victor
Meitner/Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring not to go on the Memory

Care unit

3/1323 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring's visit and sending Brandy's S50 197.50
notes

3/13/23 SMB Review of Order from Superior Court; work on file regarding deadline for .20 43.00
Appellant's Designation of Contents of Reproduced Record

3/14/23 TMG Emails with Mrs. Blumer regarding voicemail from Debbie, Brandy's notes 60 237.00

12
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Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843

' Init__ Description of Services Rendered ‘Hours _Amount

3/15/23 TMG Emails/calls regarding Victor Meitner withdrawing as counsel for Arthur 60 237.00
Herring

3/16/23 TMG Emails with Mr. Meitner regarding Arthur Herring's future visits .20 79.00

3/20123 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding late payment, allowing visit; email to 40 158.00
Victor Meitner regarding same

3/20/23 SMB Telephone conference with Mr. Gelsinger regarding case; review of 20 43.00
correspondence from Mr. Meitner

321723 TMG Review email from Court/photo of Arthur Herring protesting; review .20 474.00

Superior Court's Rule fo Show Cause; letter to Judge Weilheimer, draft
proposed Order; email to Mrs. Blumer regarding same

3/21/23 SMB Review of Order - Rule to Show Cause; work on file regarding deadline for 20 43.00
Mr. Meitner to file letter with Court with regard to satisfying collateral order
requirements

3/22/23 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss (1) posture of the various appeals filed 40 178.00

by Arthur Herring and to explain the legal issues being raised by the court
and (2) concerning behavior of Arthur Herring at his last several visits with
Jane Herring

3/22/23 SMB Review of Order suspending briefing schedule; review of correspondence .20 43.00
from Superior Court

3/24/23 WRB Email to Mrs. Blumer advising her of the request to seek modification of the .20 89.00
court's order for payment of visitation costs by Mr. Herring

3/24/23 TMG Emails with Mrs. Blumer regarding Brandy's notes, recent interactions with 70 276.50
Manatawny Manor; review Brandy's notes and email to Judge's staff; email
Mr. Meitner regarding upcoming visits, payment not received; review Order
suspending briefing schedule

3/24/23 TMG Call with Mr. Jaskowiak regarding Brandy's notes 20 79.00

3/27/23 TMG Review emails from Arthur Herring; email to Victor Meitner regarding same A0 158.00

3/27/23 TMG Review Mr. Meitner's Motion to Withdraw as Arthur Herring's counsel; 30 118.50
emails with Judge's staff regarding Judge's request for a conference

3/27/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding she does not want me to forward all of 30 118.50
Arthur Herring's emails to her

3/27/23 SMB Review of Mr. Meitner's Motion to Withdraw as Attorney 20 43.00

3/29/23 TMG Participate in cail with Judge and counsel; email update to Mrs. Blumer

.10 43450

13
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Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843
Date_Init _ Descriptionof Services Rendered .~ Hours Amount_

3/29/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding update from conference with the Court .60  237.00

3/30/23 TMG Begin to listen to recent podcast episdoc 0 276.50

3/30/23 TMG Review Herring response to Superior Court's Rule to Show Cause .20 79.00

3/30/23 SMB Review of Appellant's Reply to Order - Rule to Show Cause 20 43.00

3/31/23 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss communications between Arthur S0 222,50
Herring and his mother and their impact on her health and mood

3/31/23 TMG Finish listening to recent podcast episdoe 20 79.00

3/31/23 TMG Email to Mrs. Blumer regarding follow up from podcast 20 79.00

3/31/23 TMG Review letter from Arthur Herring to Jane Herring 20 79.00

4/03/23 TMG Review status; call with Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring's recent 1.60 632.00
behavior; email to Attorney Jaskowiak regarding same

4/03/23 TMG Call with Attorney Jaskowiak regarding developments 30 118.50

4/04/23 WRB Meeting with Mr, Gelsinger to discuss possible requests to the court in S0 22250
response to Mr. Herring's escalating misconduct and harassment

4/04/23 TMG Review status with Mr. Blumer; call with Mrs. Blumer regarding new letter B0 316.00
from Arthur Herring

4/05/23 WRB Review email sent to all lawyers at Barley Snyder, respond to inquiries from .80  356.00

attorneys regarding Mr. Herring's email and meeting with Mr. Gelsinger to
discuss alerting the court to Mr. Herring's harassment at the next status
conference

4/05/23 TMG Review Arthur Herring's email to all partners at Barley Snyder; respond to 140  553.00
inquiries from various partners

4/05/23 TMG Emails with counsel, Judge's chambers regarding Arthur Herring's request L0 237.00
for unsupervised visits; email to Vic regarding Arthur Herring’s email to
Barley partners

4/06/23 TMG Review Arthur Herring's email of 4/6/23 to Attorney Lobach 20 79.00

4/06/23 TMG Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding limiting contact from people calling Jane 30 11850
Herring on Arthur Herring's behalf

4/10/23 TMG Emails with Mrs. Blumer; review recent letter Arthur Herring tried to deliver 20 79.00

14
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Client No. 69497

Matter No. 3

July 10, 2023

Invoice No. 70461843

' ])cripof rvic nd

4/11/23

4/11/23

4/11/23

4/11/23
4/11/23
4/11/23
4/12/23

4/12/23

4/14/23

4/17/23

4/18/23

4/159/23
4/20/23

4/20/23
4/20/23
4/20/23

WRB| Meeting with Mr. Gelsinger to discuss conference with counsel and the 30
judge and the proposal to have Mr. Herring undergo a psychological
evaluation '

i

TMG Call with Attorney Jaskowiak; emails with Court regarding Judge requesting .60
zoom conference; review Arthur Herring's email to Judge's staff

TMG Zoom conference with Court and counsel regarding suggesting Arthur .60
Hertring undergo a psych evaluation

TMG Email to Mrs. Blumer regarding update on cali with the Judge 30

TMG Email to Detective Kelly per Judge's instructions 20

TMG  Follow up call with Mrs. Blumer regarding status of discussions with Judge 70

TMG Review Court's order on neuropsych evaluation for Arthur Herring ; email 20
same to Mrs. Blumer

SMB ‘| Review of Order regarding neuropsychological evaluation of Arthur 20
Herring; work on file regarding deadline to notify Court with regard to
evaluation

TMG | Emails with Mrs. Blumer regarding status of Judge's request for Arthur, 20
Herring to undergo neurospych evaluation

TMG  Emaiis with Mrs. Blumer regarding cards received by Manatawny Manor for 20
Jane Herring

WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss report from Jill Herring that Mrs. .50
Herring is upset Jill isn't supportive enough of Arthur Herring's alleged
religious ministry for women and the implication that Mrs. Herring actually
remembers more about Arthur Herring's visits than expected and how that
would impact the guardian's exercise of discretion to permit visitation with
Arthur Herring

TMG Review VidMgmm%wmwh evaluation 40

TMG/ Email update to Mrs. Blumer regarding Arthur Herring rejecting neuro/s_pﬁh‘) 20

evaluation

_f

TMG Review status of oufstanding Appeals
TMG  Call with Mrs. Blumer regarding update on case with Vic withdrawing

LBS  Meeting with Thad Gelsinger regarding appeals; meeting with Mr. Blumer
regarding additional fee petition

15

40
60

133.50

237.00

237.00

118.50
79.00
276.50
79.00

43.00

79.00

79.00

222.50

158.00
79.00

158.00
237.00
156.00




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10,2023

Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843
Date Init  Description of Services Rendered ~ Hours _Amount

4/21/23 TMG Review recent letters from Arthur Herring to Jane Herring 20 79.00

4/21/23 TMG Review order quashing Arthur Herring's appeal; emails with Mrs. Blumer 30 118.50

regarding same
4/21/23 LBS  Prepare second request for attorney fees and guardian fees 30 117.00
4/21/23 SMB Review of Order granting Motion to Withdraw as Attorney for Arthur 40 86.00

Herring; work on file regarding deadline for Arthur Herring to obtain new
counsel; review of Order quashing Appeal; review of correspondence from
Superior Court

4/25/23 WRB Meecting with Mr. Gelsinger to discuss withdrawal of Mr. Meitner, new 80  356.00
petition for approval of fees and to advise him about how Mrs. Herring is
behaving in the absence of visits by Arthur Herring and whether to give Mrs.
Herring redacted versions of the letters Arthur Herring attempts to send her,
email to Mrs. Blumer advising as to all of the above

4/25/23 TMG Email to Attorney Jaskowiak regarding order quashing appeal, eviction 20 79.00
moving forward
4/25/23 TMG Review status of guardian's position on case 40  158.00

4/25/23 TMG Review Arthur Herring's Entry of Appearance, Petition for Leave to Proceed 20 79.00
in Forma Pauperis; email to Mrs. Blumer regarding same

4/25/23 SMB Review of Entry of Appearance of Arthur Herring, I1I, pro se; review of 20 .00
Petition and Affidavit for Leave to Proceed in Forma Pauperis (NO
CHARGE)

4/26/23 TMG Call with Attorney Jaskowiak regarding eviction, Arthur Herring's pro se 30 118.50
appearance

4/26/23 TMG Review Arthur Herring's emails to Judge's staff regarding his $14,000 30 118.50
payment went to Vic for legal fees, etc.; review Judge's Order granting
Arthur Herring's petition

4/26/23 TMG Call with Attorney Fenstermacher regarding status 40  158.00

4/26/23 SMB Review of Order granting Petition to Proceed in Forma Pauperis 20 43.00

4/2723 TMG Review Judge Weilheimer's correspondence to Arthur Herring; emails with 90  355.50
Arthur Herring regarding his concerns

4/28/23 TMG Review Arthur Hetring's email to Attorney Jaskowiak, cc to me; update call 30 11850
with Attorney Jaskowiak
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Client No. 69497 ‘ July 10, 2023

Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843

5/01/23 TMG Review emails between Arthur/ MM; review Motion for Reconsideration to 60  237.00
Superior Court

5/01/23 SMB Review of Appellant's Motion to Reconsider Order dated 4/21/23 20 43.00

5/02/23 WRB Review and revise draft petition for allowance to pay guardian and counsel 30 133.50

5/02/23 WRB Review emails regarding Mr. Herring's attempt at communication with the 80 356.00

court and its response and possible settiement terms to offer that Mr. Herring
could not breach later after getting what he wants

5/02/23 WRB Review emails regarding Mr. Herring contacting a local church to visit Jane 1.20  534.00
and propose strategy for addressing his seemingly endless list of criticisms
about Mrs. Herring's care and need for stimulation, visitation and exercise

5/02/23 TMG Review emails between Arthur/Ms. Copestick; forward to Pam; call with B0  316.00
Pam regarding same, no additional action needed

5/03/23 TMG Email from Arthur regarding who directs Jane's living arrangement; email 20 79.00
with Pam regarding same
5/05/23 TMG Emails regarding zoom conference with the Court 20 79.00
5/08/23 TMG Emails regarding court conference scheduling 20 79.00
5/08/23 TMG Call with Mr. Jaskowiak; emails regarding conference with Judge, Arthur's 40 158.00
proposal
5/09/23 TMG Emails regarding setting up conference; email to Arthur regarding S0 19750
supervision is a threshold issue at this point that we cannot avoid prior to
other topics
5/09/23 SMB Review of Order denying Application for Reconsideration .20 43.00
5/10/23 TMG Email and Ca!l with Pam regarding Friday conference with Judge 60 237.00
5/10/23 SMB Check docket regarding Order Granting Waiver of Fees and Order Granting .20 43,00
Future Waiver of Fees
5/12/23 TMG Conference with Judge Weilheimer regarding Arthut's Mother's 140  553.00
Day/Birthday visits; call with Pam to review and discuss accomplishing
Judge's directives
5/12/23 TMG Review Court Order granting Arthur supervised Mother's Day/Birthday 40 158.00
visits; email to Pam regarding same; emails with Ms. Camp regarding when
Jill will be visiting
5/12/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding visitation she's able to arrange per Coust's Order 20 79.00
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ors mount

Date " Imit Dﬁon %7 eed

5/12/23 SMB Review of Report of Guardian of the Estate 20 43.00
5/13/23 TMG Email to Mr, Herring regarding visitation for Mother's Day/Jane's birthday 20 79.00
5/15/23 TMG Review Arthur's response to visitation plan; emails with Pam regarding 1.0 395.00

Brandy no longer willing to supervise; email to Arthur regarding need new
supervisor; Review Arthur's additional emails

5/15/23 TMG Call with Pam; emails from Arthur regarding visitation for Mother's S50 19750
Day/Birthday

5/15/23 SMB Review of Report of Guardian of the Estate .20 43.00

5/17/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails with questions and demand for supervision to end .20 79.00

5/19/23 TMG (iali with Pam regarding Abby not willing to supervise, working on someone 40 158.00
else

5/22/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails related to visits, housing for Jane 20 79.00

5/24/23 TMG Emails with Mr. Herring regarding visits not yet complete because no 40 158.00

supervisor has been located despite efforts, complaints that minister not
seeing Jane; email with Pam regarding same

5/24/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding ministers attempting to see Jane; update on 30 11850
supervisor

5/25/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails of the day 30 118.50

35/26/23 TMG Emails regarding Arthur's visits for Mother’s Day/Birthday 30 118.50

3/27/23 TMG Emails with Pam regarding Arthur's requests to bring ice cream/cake; review 20 79.00
Arthur's emails

5/30/23 TMG Emails with Pam and Arthur regarding Arthur's requests/demands; review 40  158.00
additional emails from Arthur

5/31/23 TMG Review Arthur's email to Ron; Emails regarding follow up visit with Jane 40  158.00
for Arthur

6/05/23 TMG Review additional emails from Arthur to counsel; review Mary Ellen's notes; 80 316.00
emails with Pam regarding status, notes; email to Court/Counsel with notes

6/05/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding update, Arthur's visits 40 158.00
6/06/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails with Ron regarding gifting; complaints about 30 118.50

monitor
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Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843

Hors Amount

Date Init  Description of Services Rendered

6/07/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails regarding follow up questions, moving Jane to 30 118,50
another facility

6/09/23 TMG Review In re IMR regarding similar factual pattern 30 118.50

6/09/23 TMG Email from Arthur requesting to meet with Pam at MM; emails with Pam 30 11850
regarding not yet scen any filing with the Supreme Court on appeals

6/13/23 TMG Review Court Order directing Dr. Ledakis to review visitation issue 20 79.00

6/14/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding update on Jane; Ledakis calling her; Judge's Order 90 35550

6/16/23 TMG Review email from Arthur regarding Pam's rates; email Dave/Ron regarding S0 197.50
appeal status; other emails from Arthur

6/16/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding Arthur's emails today 30 118.50

6/19/23 TMG Emails with Pam regarding Arthur's most recent email 20 79.00

6/22/23 TMG Emails with Court regarding Arthur's contact; emails with Arthur regarding 30 11850
his emailing to Pam

6/22/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding Arthur's emails today and Judge's decision to bar 60 237.00
his emails

6/23/23 TMG Review email/letter regarding Arthur's visit to Atty Camp's office; emails 30 11850
regarding DHS visit to Manatawny Manor

6/27/23 TMG Review Dr. Ledakis's report of 6/21/23; review Court Orders; emails to Pam S50 197.50
regarding same

6/27/23 SMB Review of Order regarding report prepared by Dr. George Ledakis; review .30 64.50

of Order regarding payment to Brandywine Neuropsychology Associates;
work on deadline to file opinion with Court regarding future visits between
Arthur Herring, Il and Jane Herring

6/28/23 WRB Meeting with Mr. Gelsinger to discuss how to respond to the report from Dr. A0 178.00
Ledakis and how to craft a proposed order for the court that limits ongoing
petitions for visitation that serve only to deplete Mrs. Herring's estate

6/28/23 TMG Emails with Pam regarding response to Judge's Order; review potential 90 35550
strategy regarding visitation
6/28/23 SMB Review of Certificate of Remittal/Remand of Record 20 43.00

6/29/23 TMG Begin drafting response to Court’s Order on Ledakis report; emails with Pam 3.80 1,501.00
regarding same '
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Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70461843
Date Init Descrlpt!on of Services Rendered WW” ‘Hours Amount
6/29/23 TMG Review Arthur's Emergency Motion for Unsupervised Visitation 30 118.50
6/29/23 SMB Review of Motion for Order Directing Sheriff Regarding Eviction Process; 70 150.50

review of Praecipe to Attach Notice to Plead to Motion; review of Petition
for Allowance of Fees and Expenses; review of Emergency Petition of
Arthur Herring, III for Unsupervised Visitation with Jane Herring; work on
deadline to file response to Petition of Arthur Herring, III; review of List of
Record Documents Sent to all Counsel and Unrepresented Parties; review of

Proof of Service for List

6/30/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding Arthur's Emergency Petition, response to Court's 140  553.00
order on visits; continue revise response; email to Pam regarding same

6/30/23 TMG Call with Attorney Jaskowiak regarding status, opinion response to the 30 118.50
Court

6!30/23 SMB Ofﬁce confercnce with Mr. Blumer regardmg case 20 43.00

Blumer, William R. Partner 2.10 415.00 B871.50
Blumer, William R. Partner 26.20 435.00 11,397.00
Blumer, William R. Partner 15.30 445.00 6,808.50
Gelsinger, Thad M. Partner 104.90 395.00 41,435.50
Schuenemann, Latisha Bern Partner 1.90 350.00 665.00
Schuenemann, Latisha Bern Partner 1.70 370.00 629.00
Schuenemann, Latisha Bern Partner 4.10 390.00 1,599.00
Baro, Sharon M. Paralegal 10.40 215.00 2,236.00
TOTALS - ) 166.60 _ $65 641.50

DISBURSEN[ENTS

Date Descrlphon Amount
9/20/22 Cardmember Services, Montgomery County Orphans’ Court Division Filing 65.59
1/10/23 Mr. Gelsinger, Mileage to Lehigh County for Hearing, 11/16/2022 88.75
1/10/23 Parking, Lehigh County for Hearing, 11/16/2022 8.00
1/24/23 Cardmember Services, Montgomery County Orphans' Court, Record 225
2/02/23 Cardmember Services, Montgomery County Orphans’ Court, Filing 65.59
4/10/23 Mr. Gelsinger, Travel expense to Montgomery County Courthouse, 2/09/2023 34.25
4/10/23 Mr. Gelsinger, Travel expense to Mongtomery County Courthouse, 2/ 15/2023

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 5 298.68
TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 65,940.18
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Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70507638

RE: Herring, Jane T. - Guardianship
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

"Date Init _ Description of Services Rendered ~  Hours_Amount_

7/0523 TMG Emails with Pam Blumer regarding her thoughts on visitation; call 96 35550
regarding same; revise response to Court

7/06/23 TMG Email from Arthur regarding unable to view docket; email to Pam 20 79.00
Blumer regarding same

7/07/23 TMG Draft response to Arthur's Emergency Petition for Unsupervised 330 1,303.50
Visitation; emails with Pam Blumer regarding same

7/10/23 TMG Emails with Pam Blumer regarding response to Arthur's Petition; 80  316.00
revisions to Response per Pam Blumer's feedback; call with Pam
Blumer regarding same

7/10/23 LBS Review and revise petition for allowarnce; letter to all regarding petition; 2.00  780.00
electronically file petition for allowance

7/10/23 SMB Review and revise Response to Arthur Herring's Emergency Petition; 190  408.50
review and revise Response to Court Order on Arthur Herring's
Visitation; preparation of Certificate of Service for Response to
Emergency Petition; telephone conference with Mr. Gelsinger regarding
Responses and case; preparation of Verification for Response to Court
Order on Arthur Herring's Visitation; preparation of email to Ms.

Blumer
7/11/23 TMG Review Mr. Jaskowiak's and Mr. Herring's response to the Court's Order 90 355.50
7/11/23 SMB Meet with Pamela Blumer regarding Verifications for Responses; efile 1.80  387.00

Response to the Court's Order of June 27, 2023; preparation of
correspondence to counsel; review of Arthur Herring's Response to

Court Order on Visitation
7/12/23 TMG Review Response to Judge's Order from Jill Herring; emails with Pam .30 118.50
Blumer regarding responses; review Jaskowiak response to Emergency
Petition
7/12/23 TMG Call with Pam Blumer regarding status with all submissions in file 30 118.50
7/12/23 SMB Review of Answer of Jill Scott Herring to June 27, 2023 Court Order; 130  279.50

Review of Answer of David Jaskowiak to Emergency Petition for
Unsupervised Visitation by Arthur Herring; efile Response to Arthur
Herring's Emergency Petition for Unsupervised Visitation; preparation
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Client No. 69497 ‘ December 6, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70507638
" Date Init Description of Services Rendered Amount
7/13/23 TMG Review Arthur's email to FBI; emails with Pam Blumer regarding same 20 79.00
711723 TMG Review Arthur's Emergency Response to Petition for Eviction; email to 90 35550
Pam Blumer regarding same; review Arthur's response to Jaskowiak fee
petition
7/17/23 SMB Review of Notifications from Court; review of docket for recent filings; J0 150.50

review of Arthur Herring's Emergency Response to Petition for
Eviction; review of Arthur Herring's Motion to Deny Petition for
Allowance of Fees and Expenses to David Jaskowiak

7/18/23 TMG Emails with Pam Blumer regarding Arthur's Response to Jaskowiak .20 79.00
Petition for Fees

7/21/23 TMG Review emails between Mr. Jaskowiak and Arthur regarding Arthur 20 79.00
relitigating isuses

7/24/23 TMG Call with Pam Blumer regarding status, calls with Jill 40 158.00

7/25/23 TMG Review Court's Orders regarding visitation, neuropsychological 80 316.00

evaluation; email to Pam Blumer regarding same; follow up call with
Pam Blumer regarding same

7/25/23 SMB Review of Order granting Attorney Jaskowiak's Petition for Allowance; 30 64.50
review of Order regarding Arthur Herring's Petition for Unsupervised
Visitation; review of Order regarding neuropsychological evaluation of

Arthur Herring

7/26/23 TMG Review eviction order and email to Pam Blumer regarding same 20 79.00

7/26/23 TMG Call with Pam Blumer regarding some covid cases at Manatawny .20 79.00
Manor, not on Jane's area; wait to see how it progresses

7126123 TMG Review Arthur's objections to Fee Petition; Petition to remove Guardian .60 237.00
of the Estate

7/26/23 SMB  Review of Order evicting Arthur Herring; review of Arthur Herring's 30 64.50

Petition to Remove Ronald Fenstermacher as Guardian of Estate of Jane
Herring; review of Arthur Herring's Reply to our Petition for Allowance

8/01/23 TMG Review Arthur's emergency petition for stay of eviction; call with Pam 90  355.50
Blumer regarding recent events

8/01/23 SMB Review of Arthur Herring's Emergency Petition for Supersedeas Stay of .20 43.00
Eviction Order
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Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70507638

" Date Init Description of Services Rendered - " Hours Amount

8/04/23 TMG Emails with Pam Blumer regarding no contact from Arthur; everyone .20 79.00
ready for a visit if he goes to Manatawny Manor

8/08/23 TMG Call with Pam Blumer regarding Chester Co. Department of Ageing call 20 79.60

to her per Arthur's visitation
8/08/23 SMB Review of file regarding status of our Petition for Allowance of Fees .20 43.00
8/09/23 TMG Review Court's Orders on Arthur's Petition for Supersedeas and to 60 237.00

Remove Ron as Guardian; email same to Pam Blumer; review
email/letter from Ms. Copestick; review Arthur's Petition for Judge's

Removal

8/09/23 TMG Call with Pam Blumer regarding update on petitions/Orders/Arthur's 30 118.50
letter

8/09/23 SMB Review of Order denying Arthur Herring's Petition to Remove Ronald S0 107.50

Fenstermacher, Esquire as Guardian of the Estate for Jane Herring;
review of Order denying Arthur Herring's Petition for Supersedeas to
Stay Eviction Order; review of Arthur Herring's Emergency Petition for
Judge Weilheimer to Recuse Herself, review of correspondence from

Mr. Herring
8/10/23 TMG Review Arthur's email of the day 20 79.00
8/18/23 TMG Emails.with.Pam Blumer regarding not heard from Arthur regarding 20 79.00
upcoming visits
8/21/23 TMG Review Arthur's email to Fenstermacher 20 79.00
8/22/23 TMG Call with Pam Blumer regarding Arthur's visits 40  158.00
8/23/23 TMG Email to Arthur regarding Labor Day visit rescheduled for that 20 79.00
Wednesday
8/28/23 TMG Emails with Pam Blumer regarding Jane note from Mary Ellen 20 79.00
8/20/23 TMG Review email from Arthur regarding eviction 20 79.00
2/29/23 TMG Zoom conference with Judge and counsel; call with Pam Blumer J0 0 276.50
regarding same
8/30/23 TMG Emails with Pam Blumer regarding she and Manatawny Manor would .20 79.00

like local law officials to know Arthur's activities; email to Ms.
Copestick regarding same

Emails regarding eviction status 20 79.00
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Matter No. 3 Inveice No. 70507638
" Date Init  Descriptionof Services Rendered ___ Hours Amount
9/08/23 TMG Review Arthur's email to me and Mr. Fenstermacher; email Arthur 20 79.00
regarding supervisor no longer available on Mondays but can do
Wednesdays
9/11/23 TMG Review emails from Arthur to me and Manatawny Manor 20 79.00
9/12/23 TMG Communications with Mr. Jaskowiak regarding eviction proceeding; 20 79.00
email to Pam Biumer regarding same
9/19/23 WRB Telephone conference with Mrs. Blumer to discuss order scheduling .20 89.00
review hearing and whether she needed to have witnesses testify about
vigitation by Mr. Herring and his frequent emails to the care facility
9/19/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails regarding birthday, not visiting Jane 20 79.00
9/20/23 SMB Review of Order for review hearing on visitation; review of Order 30 64.50
denying Arthur Herring's Petition for Recusal of Judge Weilheimer;
review of Certificate of Service for posting of 7/25/23 Order
9/25/23 TMG Call with Pam Blumer regarding Hearing on Arthur’s petition; email 90  355.50
with Pam Blumer regarding case may be reassigned
9/25/23 TMG Begin to review for Hearing on Arthur's Petition 140  553.00
9/26/23 TMG Calls with Pam Blumer regarding potential reassignment of judge; 1.20 474.00
hearing preparations
9/26/23 TMG Call with Mr. Jaskowiak regarding hearing 30 118,50
9/27/23 TMG Review Arthur's email repeating similar claims/accusations 20 79.00
9/28/23 LAL Prepare Third Petition for Allowance for attorney fees 1.50  322.50
10/02/23 TMG Review Arthur's email to Mr. Fenstermacher, Mr. Jaskowiak email to 20 79.00
Arthur regarding hearing
10/02/23 TMG Review emails/supervisor notes for hearing on Petition for 190 750.50
Unsupervised Visitation
10/02/23 TMG Call with Pam Blumer regarding prep for hearing 20 79.00
10/03/23 TMG Calls with Pam Blumer, Mr, Jaskowiak, Mr, Fenstermacher; draft 1.60 632.00
stipulation and Order to take Jane personal items; email to counsel
regarding Stipulation

10/04/23 TMG Review potential exhibits and participate in hearing on Arthur's Petition 3.80 1,501.00
for Unsupervised Visitation




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ‘ December 6, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70507638

Date Init __ Description of Services Rendered _Hours _Amount
10/04/23 SMB Review of Order regarding Arthur Herring's modified visitations 20 43.00
10/05/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails and emails with Pam Blumer regarding same; 130 513.50

call with Pam Blumer regarding same and reviewing from hearing,
upcoming visits
10/05/23 LBS  Meeting with Thad regarding hearing and fee petition 30 117.00
10/06/23 TMG Email from Arthur responding to position on his questions for visit 20 79.00
10/09/23 TMG Review Arthur's follow up emails regarding visit 20 79.00
10/13/23 TMG Emails with Pam regarding Arthur's upcoming visit .20 79.00
10/16/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails from the weekend/today 20 79.00
10/16/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding Arthur's emails and upcoming visit 40 158.00
10/17/23 TMG Review Arthur's email regarding food; email to Pam regarding same 20 79.00
10/17/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding Arthur's visit, addressing documents he claims 30 11850
he'll bring
10/18/23 WRB Email to Attorney Jaskowiak regarding living will for Jane Herring and 40 178.00
need to petition for authorization to make end of life care decisions
10/19/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding Arthur's visit 40 158.00
10/20/23 WRB Review and reply to email from David Jaskowiak, Esq. after reading S0 22250
over Ms. Herring's living will
10/20/23 SMB Review of Emergency Petition for Hearing to Prove Arthur Herring a 60 129.00

Danger or Menace to Jane Herring; review of Emergency Petition for
Hearing to Remove Pam Blumer as Guardian; review of Emergency
Petition for a Hearing to Remove David Jaskowiak as Lawyer of Jane
Herring; review of Emergency Petition to Remove Ronald
Fenstermacher as Guardian of the Estate of Jane Herring; work on file
regarding deadline to respond to the Petitions

10/23/23 WRB Review docket for resignation of Dwayne Logie, draft petition to accept 1.80  801.00
resignation of guardian of the person

10/23/23 TMG Review notes from supervised visit; email from Mr. Herring; email to 40 158.00
Court regarding visit notes

16/23/23 LBS  Telephone conference with Bill Blumer regarding petition to accept 30 117.00
resignation




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 ‘ December 6, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70507638

Date Init _ Description of Services Rendered ~ Hours Amount
10/23/23 SMB Review of Motion to Strike Four Emergency Petitions filed by Arthur 20 43.00
Herring and Suspend his In Forma Pauperis Privileges filed by Attorney
Jaskowiak
10/26/23 SMB Review of Orders regarding Emergency Petitions of Arthur Herring .20 43.00

10/27/23 WRB Review Superior Court case In Re McCloud Estate regarding disposition S0 222.50
of pro se appeal for failure to present actual legal arguments and the
resulting waiver of claims

10/30/23 WRB Meeting with Mrs. Blumer to discuss impact of emails from Jill Herring .80 356.00
on Pam's care recommendations and petition to withdraw as guardian of
the person, email to Ikor to determine if it would assume role as

guardian of the person
10/30/23 TMG Review emails from Arthur over the weekend regarding wanting to 60 23700
bring food; call with Pam regarding update
10/30/23 TMG Review Petition to Withdraw Required Minimum Distributions 20 79.00
11/01/23 TMG Calls with Atty Jaskowiak and call with Pam regarding status 40 158.00
11/02/23 TMG Brief review of Arthur's Response to Jaskowiak Motion to Strike 20 79.00
Arthur's 4 Petitions
11/02/23 LBS Email Thad regarding petition for fees 20 78.00
11/02/23 SMB Review of Arthur Herring's Reply to Motion to Strike Four Emergency 30 64.50

Petitions and Suspend His in Forma Pauperis Privileges; review of
Order regarding Petition for Fees

11/06/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails from the weekend 20 79.00
11/06/23 TMG Begin to draft Consent and Joinders to Preliminary Objections 150  592.50
11/06/23 LBS Review and revise joinders and consents to preliminary objections 50 195.00




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 A December 6, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70507638

Date Init Description of Services Rendered Hours Amount
11/06/23 SMB Review of Attorney Jaskowiak's Preliminary Objections to Arthur .60 129.00
Herring's Petition to Prove Whether he is a Danger or Menace; review
of Attorney Jaskowiak's Preliminary Objections to Arthur Herring's
Petition to Remove Pam Blumer as Guardian for Jane Herring; review
of Attorney Jaskowiak's Preliminary Objections to Arthur Herring's
Petition to Remove Attomey Jaskowiak as Guardian for Jane Herring;
review of Attorney Jaskowiak's Preliminary Objections to Arthur
Herring's Petition to Remove Attorney Fenstermacher as Guardian for
Jane Herring; review of Memorandums of Law in Support of each
Preliminary Objection filed by Attorney Jaskowiak

11/07/23 SMB Review and revise all four Consent and Joinders to Preliminary 1.50  322.50
Objections filed by Attorney Jaskowiak; review of file; preparation of
Certificates of Service for all four Consent and Joinders;

11/08/23 SMB Efile all four Consent and Joinders to Preliminary Objections of 2.60 559.00
Attorney Jaskowiak; preparation of correspondence to counsel and Mr.
Herring; review of Emergency Petition to Unblock Arthur Herring's

Email to all County Agencies

11/09/23 TMG Review Arthur's Petition to Unlock his email access to county agencies 20 79.00

11/09/23 SMB Review of Order regarding Arthur Herring's Petition to Unblock Email 20 43.00
to All County Agencies not an emergency

11/13/23 TMG Email from Arthur regarding demanding to know why he cannot have 20 79.00
lunch with Jane

11/13/23 TMG Call with Pam regarding Jane's fall; email to Arthur regarding same 40 158.00

11/15/23 TMG Cali with Pam regarding update from Arthur's visit with Jane today 30 118.50

11/15/23 SMB Review of Petition to Withdraw Required Minimum Distribution from 20 43,00
Individual Retirement Account

11/16/23 TMG Review notes from Arthur's 11/15/23 visit with Jane; email same to the 20 79.00




Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497 A December 6, 2023
Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70507638

_Date_Init _Description of Services Rendered “Hours _Amount

11/16/23 SMB Review of Arthur Herring's Reply to Preliminary Objections to 40 86.00
Emergency Petition to Remove Pam Blumer as Guardian for Jane
Herring; review of Arthur Herring's Reply to Preliminary Objections to
Emergency Petition to Remove Ronald Fenstermacher as Guardian for
Jane Herring; review of Arthur Herring's Reply to Preliminary
Objections to Emergency Petition to Remove David Jaskowiak as
Counsel for Jane Herring; review of Arthur Herring's Reply to
Preliminary Objections to Emergency Petition to Prove He is a Danger
and Menace to Jane Herring; review of Arthur Herring's Reply to
Attorney Jaskowiak's Motion to Strike Four Emergency Petitions and to
Suspend His in Forma Pauperis Privileges

11/19/23 LBS  Revise petition to accept resignation as guardian of the person .80  312.00
11/20/23 WRB Revise petition to resign as guardian of the person 30 133.50
11/20/23 TMG Review Arthur's emails from the weekend; email with Pam regarding .80 316.00
whether she feels that we need to respond; follow up call with Pam
regarding Arthur's emails

11/20/23 LBS Meeting with Bill regarding revisions to petition and information needed 20 78.00

11/21/23 WRB Telephone conference with Mr. Dennis Mahoney from Ikor regarding 80 356.00
taking over as the guardian of the person for Mrs. Herring

11/23/23 TMG Review Arthur's various emails reciting past concemns 20 79.00

11/27/23 WRB Meeting with Ms. Schuenemann to update guardian resignation petition S0 222.50
to include a request to appoint IKOR as the successor guardian

11/27/23 TMG  Call with Pam regarding update on Petition to Withdraw .20 79.00

11/27/23 LBS  Revise resignation petition 40 156,00

11/27/23 SMB Review of Reply of Arthur Herring to Consent and Joinder to the 40 86.00

Preliminary Objections to Arthur Herring's "Emergency Motion" to
Remove Pam Blumer and Her Entourage as Guardian of Person of Jane
Herring; review of Reply of Arthur Herring to Consent and Joinder to
Preliminary Objections to Prove if Arthur Herring is a Danger or
Menace to Jane Herring; review of Reply of Arthur Herring to Consent
and Joinder to the Preliminary Objections to Arthur Herring's
"Emergency Motion" to Remove David A. Jaskowiak as Counsel for
Jane Herring; review of Reply of Arthur Herring to Consent and Joinder
to the Preliminary Objections to Arthur Herring's "Emergency Motion"
to Remove Ron Fenstermacher as Guardian of Estate of Jane Herring
L —— — - — = -]



Barley Snyder

Client No. 69497
Matter No. 3

Init

I}escription Services Rendered

December 6, 2023
Invoice No. 70507638

rs Aou

11/28/23 1LBS

11/28/23 SMB

11/29/23

Telephone conference with Pam Blumer regarding revisions to petition; 60

234.00

revise petition; email Dennis Mahoney regarding petition and consent

for review and signature

Reply of Arthur Herring to Jaskowiak's Memorandum in Support of his 30

64.50

Preliminary Objections to Four Emergency Petitions, review of Exhibits

to Reply; review of Arthur Herring's Petition to Compel Ronald

Fenstermacher to Make Compensation to Arthur Herring for Living
Accommodations; review of Exhibits to Reply

Review Arthur's email reciting same issues; email with Pam regarding 20

Arthur copying "60 Minutes" show

11/30/23
12/05/23

12/05/23

12/06/23

Review Emails from Arthur to me and Pam revisiting same issues; 30

Review Arthur's email to Atty Fenstermacher

emails with Pam regarding same

Review of Response of Ronald Fenstermacher to Arthur Herring's 20
Petition to Compel Compensation for Living Accommodations

le

Finalize petition and exhibits; electronically file petition and certificate: .80
tter to all regarding service of notice to plead and petition

79.00

.20 79.00
118.50

43.00

312.00

Name Status Hours Rate Total
Blumer, William R. Partner 5.80 445.00 2,581.00
Gelsinger, Thad M. Partner 37.90 395.00 14,970.50
Schuenemann, Latisha Bern Partner 6.10 390.00 2,379.00
Baro, Sharon M. Paralegal 15.40 215.00 3,311.00
Lasco, Lisa A. Paralegal 1.50 215.00 322.50
TOTALS 66.70 $23,564

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

10

$ 23,564.00
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Matter No. 3 Invoice No. 70507638
DISBURSEMENTS

_Date_Description ' T Amount

7/10/23 Cardmember Services, Montgomery County Orphans' Court, Filing 65.59

7/11/23  Cardmember Services, Montgomery County Orphans' Court, Efile Response to 21.50

Court Order on Arthur Herring's Visitation
7/12/23 Cardmember Services, Montgomery County Orphans' Court, Efile Response to 21.50
's Emer

Arthur Herring gency Petition for Unsupervised Visits

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $108.59
TOTAL THIS INVOICE $23.672.59

OUTSTANDING INVOICES
Iovoice @ Date = Invoice = Payments Ending
Number Total Received Balance
70461843 _7/10/23 65,940.18 00

Previous Balance $£65,940.18
Balance Due This Invoice $23.672.59
" TOTAL BALANCE DUE -5 8961277

Il
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IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS OF MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA

ORPHANS' COURT DIVISION

IN RE: JANE T. HERRING, :
AN INCAPACITATED PERSON : FILE NO. 2021-X2110

RESIGNATION OF PAMELA WOODWARD BLUMER

I, PAMELA WOODWARD BLUMER, hereby tender my resignation as the permanent
plenary Guardian of the Person of Jane T. Herring, an incapacitated person. [ intend for this
resignation to be effective upon the appointment of a successor permanent plenary guardian of the
person of Jane T. Herring, an incapacitated person, by the Court of Common Pleas of Montgomery
County, Pennsylvania, Orphans’ Court Division.

’_;E I tender this resignation with regret as I have truly enjoyed my interactions with Jane T.____‘_5

et

Herring during my tenure as the Guardian of her person. However, the combative and litigious
—— - R e

nature of her son, Arthur Herring, III, and the need to respond repeatedly to his false and
o e et e e —————— e T

unsubstantiated allegations relating to his mother’s care and his assertion of his own non-existent

R

legal rights as Jane T. Herring’s son places an untenable burden on me that adversely impacts my

ability to fulfill my fiduciary obligations to my other wards. It also has a negative impact on my
— 7 b it

Efgt_al_llga_l_tl_l. fu-thur Herring III’s public and defamatory allegations against me and his repeated

r——

petitions for my removal as his mother’s guardian have also made it challenging for me to maintain

professional liability insurance coverage which is vital to my work as a professional fiduciary.

re— e e e e e et ™

Accordingly, I am no longer willing to endure the personal attacks by Arthur Herring, IIT

and his interference with my work on behalf of other incapacitated individuals. The resulting
e e e =~
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difficulties his conduct has on my ability to maintain professional liability insurance coverage also

__/—"—ﬁ—“"x—\w—__—-— ——

makes my continued service as the ghardian of the person for Jane T, Herring unduly burdensome.
e e

Date:

e P

C b e, (i S it e

11100387 |

Pamela Woodward Blumer, Plenary
Permanent Guardian of the Person, Jane T,
Herring, an incapacitated person



IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS OF MONTGOMERY COUJNTY, //
PENNSYLVANIA

ORPHANS’ COURT DIVISION
NO: 2021-X2110
IN RE: JANE T. HERRING
_ AN ALLEDGED INCAPACITATED PERSON

Reply to petition to accept resignation of guardian of person, pam blumer, to  Jane Herring.

Petitioner, Rev. Arthur Herring, ill, pro se (hereinafter referred to as “Arthur”) files this Reply to
petition to accept the resignation of guardian of person, pam blumer, to Jane Herring. Arthur is requesting a
hearing on this matter of change of guardians. In addition, under PA law Title 20, section 5521, lane has the
legal right to be there at the hearing to finally be able to speak for herself and determine what she wants after
two years of being denied to do so. If necessary, a subpoena will be issued by Arthur for Jane to he there so
her voice will finally be heard in this guardianship corruption on her for the past two years,

1. Denied. Pam blumer {blumer} was never a guardian to Jane in any sense of the word. Blumer’s
business is only to make money by deceptive practices, not to care the elderly and cater to their needs, wants
and happiness. Blumer had no legal authority or right to hire anyone she wanted, spend what ever she wanted
and then bill Jane for it. Her hired entourage, included her lawyer husband bill, is related to pam by marriage
and violates the Canons of Ethics since they share the profits of what he makes. Blumer then hired many
ilawyers in his law firm. Blumer’s entourage included a “care manager” deb klock, who has a well known and
documented history of stealing from her clients and over drugging them. Jane Herring {(}ane) was never proven
to be “incapacitated” in the real world. A paid off psychologist, ledakis, claimed Jane flunked his so-called
“evaluation”. Ledakis admitted in court his “evaluation” had no independent proof of accuracy, he could not
prove Jane ever had such a “evaluation” because he never audio or video records his sessions, therefor
ledakis’s "report” and his later ones cannot be proven they only pertain to Jane and not hundreds of other
people. Jaskowiak, court appointed lawyer by weilheimer for Jane and a member of the Racket, refused to
bring Jane into court so she could speak for herself and refused to bring in any of the professional people Jane
dealt with every year to prove Jane did not need any guardians. Jaskowiak refused to defend Jane against
guardianship because Jaskowiak wanted Jane to be guardianized for the Racket for Jane’s vast assets.

2. Agreed.

3. Denied. lane is a prisoner, not a resident, at a very low rated, disease infested nursing home, Jane has
never been allowed to leave her place in two years to enjoy life in society as she had before the guardianship
scam was started by her estranged daughter, jsh. Contrary to the Racket’s own expert, ledakis, he said lane
could live at home and with Arthur there everything was fine. But, Jane was kidnapped from her home by
Logie and jsh, put through 2 weeks of torture and torment that led to Jane being taken away, unconscious, by
ambulance to a hospital, confined to bed for 6 weeks and treated for starvation. Jane had to have daily biood
tests (42 times) anddaily needles in the stomach to prevent blood clots {42 times) and then got covid. Jane's
first “guardian” and jsh then dumped Jane into her current prison. Jane has been forced to live there in
solitary confinement, in a sensory deprived environment and been refused to be allowed by blumer (Racket)
to go into society and back to her home to be with her much loved possessions and to enjoy life as she was
living free and happy in her large 3 bedroom, 3 bath house in a gated community of 21 years. Jane was never
claimed to have any mental or behavior problems that would make her a danger to herself or others.




Blumer/Racket have used barbaric and inhumane treatment on Jane since blumer was appointed “guardian”
(owner) to Jane in May 2022. Such barbaric treatment include keeping Jane away from her much loved son,
Arthur, who both have always had a very long and loving relationship as Mother and son with gross, inhumane
visit limitations. From August 25 2021, when Jane was kidnapped by Logie and jsh to December 1 2023, based
on 16 hour days (8 hours for sleep) out of a possible 13,730 hours Jane and Arthur could be together, they
were only allowed 222 hours, with many of those limited hours they were spied on by the staff and paid liars
hired by blumer and paid for by Arthur. Blumer’s purpose was harassment and retaliation by Blumer/Racket
because of Arthur exposing the money scam on Jane by blumer/Racket.

4, Agreed. Good by and good riddance. Blumer/Racket have caused great and irreversible damage to
Jane’s physical, mental and financial harm to Jane and caused Jane such daily unhappiness and lonliness that
such elder abuse cannoct be measured by anyone,

5. Denied. Strict proof demanded at trial. Arthur was constantly finding many problems with blumer’s
gross ignorance of the law and the caring of Jane, starting with Jane's age of 96. Arthur’s emails to blumer,
gelsinger, jaskowiak, fenstermacher and logie prove those constant problems and lack of correcting those
problems by guardians paid for by Jane. Since the beginning of the “guardianship, Arthur was aware Jane was
only a bank account to blumer/Racket, but he refused to allow his much loved Mother to be used as a bank
account. Today, POW'’s, under the Geneva Convention, have more privileges than Jane. Prisoner’s convicted of
all types of crimes, have more priviliges than Jane. Jane, with blumer/Racket, have none of those priviliges,
including freedom. PA Title 20, section 5521 dictates how guardianships and guardians are supposed to do
their jobs. Blumer/Racket have refused to follow that law and other laws. Blumer/Racket have refused to
follow the federal Olmsted Act that says a person with a disability cannot be warehoused if another place is
available. The Americans with Disabilities Act says people with a memory impairment are considered disabled.
Mother has a house to go home to and live. Pennsylvania law demands the least restrictive way for a person,
before guardianship, who is incapacitated. Jane did not have any problems with medical, physical or financial
matters, no unpaid taxes, no unpaid bills. Blumer’s “guardianship” is solely based on fraud for financial profit
by blumer/Racket. When Blumer was hired, she commited fraud by claiming she had been certified as a
guardian by a business doing so.

6. Denied. Blumer/Racket is only trying tc deflect their corruption and gross incompetence on Jane by
blaming Arthur with their made up lies since May 2022 when blumer was appointed. Blumer said in court she
had 10 other “clients”{victims) and admitted she had 70 total “clients”{victims) in 11 years.

If blumer/Racket any of my statements are false, let them file a lawsuit against me. | welcome it. | will have
many subpoena’s for people and documents that will prove they are only a criminal enterprise that scams
people out of their assets using fake guardianships, corrupt judges, corrupt lawyers and corrupt psychologists.
Their current and previous victims will want to join in that lawsuit.

7. Cannot comment as to truth of that statement.

8. See. #7. Arthur will have questions for Mr. Mahoney in court to avoid any more barbaric and inhumane
treatment to Jane that she has suffered with blumer/Racket for the past 1.5 years and to avoid the massive
corruption and incompetence, including the senseless waste of her finances to Jane at this late stage of her
life, and to be sure Jane will enjoy the happiness and freedom to that she had before jsh started this money
scam on Jane and Arthur.

9. | will welcome Mr. Mahoney, if he is chosen, and hope he will do what he promised to do in his
acceptance of being a guardian to Jane. | hope Mr. Mahoney will begin by taking Jane back home to live as she
was before she became a victim of this guardianship scam and where ledakis said she could live in his first
“evaluation”. Once home, Mother would be free once again, to enjoy the pleasures of life, her large home, her
much loved possessions, her happy daily life as a human being and to be with the son who she loves and has



always trusted to help and protect her when she ever needed it. There are many laws designed to protect the
elderly from this type of scam of guardianship corruption that have been completely ignored by
blumer/Racket that | would expect any honest and caring guardian of person to carry out for his client. | am
glad blumer will be replaced because | only want and have only wanted the best life for my Mother.
Guardian fees and attorney fees

A. Inventory

10-12. Denied. There must be an independent audit of Jane’s estate. There have been too many sticky
fingers that have had unlimited access to debit cards, withdrawls, etc, which have been approved by guardians
of the estate and wetlheimer without any evidence to back them up.

B. Dependents- None
Agreed.
C. Creditors- None

Denied. There has been too much secrecy to know what loans, etc have been taken out by guardians,
lawyers, etc.

D. Previous distributions.
Denied. Proof is needed at hearing.
E. Amount/Reason for Request.

16. a& b. Denied. The two most important questions must be asked: 1. What did pam blumer do after she was
hired to make Mother’s life better in any way than before blumer was hired? 2. What did pam blumer do to
continue the happy and healthy life Mother had before blumer was her guardian? Answer: Nothing. A
guardian has a specific duty. Blumer totally failed in her obligations as a guardian. Blumer never did her job
and there is no reason for her to be paid. Mother is far worse off now after having blumer for 1.5 years than
before. Pam biumer was the only one appointed by the court. She was only entitled to her billing hour of $100
an hour, no other “extra’s”. Sometime in 2022, she gave herself a pay raise to $125 an hour without
permission by anyone. Immediately after being hired, Blumer took it upon herself to hire lawyers, including
her husband bill as part of her “staff”, Hiring bill was a clear conflict of interest in the Rules of Conduct for
lawyers. Bill blumer then hired other lawyers in his law firm just to create padded billing hours to make more
money for himself, his wife, family and barley Snyder. Pam biumer had no legal rights to charge Jane for her
newly hired staff. Blumer/Barley Snyder fees are excessive and not supported by anyone approving his hiring
and there was no fee agreement approved by the court. Jaskowiak basically handled all matters on behalf of
Jane as her court appointed lawyer and pam blumer did not need a second lawyer representing her business.
Barley/Snyder did nothing for Jane’s benefit and those lawyer fees also benefited blumer’s family by any fees
paid to barley/Snyder. Blumer also kept a “care manager” deb klock on that previous guardian Logie hired,
also without permission by the court. Klock has a well known history of stealing and over drugging her victims.
All of those “entourage” expenses are now being charged to Jane. All expenses by pam blumer, in her
business, are her responsibility, NOT lane’s. Blumer/lawyers have been and still are blaming Arthur for
unnecessary emails and lawyer fees only to deflect biumer’s massive failure as a guardian, including her gross
incompetence, corruption and failure to obey the national law of Olmsted Act and various Pennsylvania laws
of guardianship: Title 20, section 5521 and Pennsylvania demanding the victim live in the least restrictive way
before guardianship. There were never any examples in court that Jane needed guardians and weitheimer’s
lawyer for Jane, jaskowiak, deliberately refused to defend and protect Jane from guardianship because he
wanted Jane to be guardianized for lane’s vast assets. Pam blumer has seen Jane and her 71 other victims she
has had as only bank accounts to use for blumer’s and Barley Snyder’s financial enrichment at the expense of
elderly people’s pain and suffering. Arthur’s constant emails of problems affecting Jane, since may 2022, have
either never been read and/or never corrected by pam blumer. To blumer and the Racket, Jane only exists to



make them richer, not for Jane’s welfare and happiness. Under blumer’s “ownership” Mother declined
physically, mentally, financially and her happiness has basically evaporated. On December 18, 2023, gelsinger
informed Arthur a week ago fane felt dizzy and was taken to the hospital. Gelsinger said the doctors said she
had a subdural hematoma. It was because she fell a month ago because of the lack of exercise, medication
and the constant slippery floors. | gave Mother several pairs of no slip socks 2 years ago, but the staff refuses
to make sure they are on, just like the TED socks that are supposed to be on her legs. In contrast, when Arthur
lived with Jane for about 1.5 years, before Jane was kidnapped by jsh and logie, Jane had no problems and life
everyday was happy, fulfilling and nobody was stealing her money. Even ledakis said so in his first report

Submitted

Rev. Arthur Herring Il
258 N. west End Bl #153
Quakertown, PA 18951
215.960.4447
Tomlinher1925@tutanota.com

December 20 2023



BARLEY SNYDER, LLP ;

Thad M. Gelsinger, Esquire

Attomney LD. No. 208233

Latisha Bernard Schuenemann, Esquire

Attorney [.D. No. 204574

William R. Blumer, Esquire

Attorney L.D. No. 59853

2735 Century Boulevard

Wyomissing, PA 19610

(610) 372-3500

Attorneys for Pamela Woodward Blumer, Guardian of the Person, Jane T. Herring, an Incapacitated Person

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS OF MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA
ORPHANS’ COURT DIVISION

IN RE: JANE T. HERRING, :
AN INCAPACITATED PERSON : FILE NO. 2021-X2110

PETITION TO ACCEPT RESIGNATION OF GUARDIAN OF THE PERSON

TO THE HONORABLE, JUDGES OF SAID COURT:
GENERAL INFORMATION

L. Pamela Woodward Biumer a/k/a Pamela W. Blumer is the Plenary Guardian of the
Person of Jane T. Herring, an incapacitated person (the “Incapacitated Person™).

2. Pamela W. Blumer is not related to the Incapacitated Person. She was appointed by
this Court on May 13, 2022.

3. Jane T. Herring is currently a resident of Manatawny Manor located at 30 Oid
Schuylkill Road, Pottstown, Pennsylvania 19465 and is retired.

RESIGNATION

4, Petitioner is requesting the acceptance of her resignation as Plenary Guardian of
the Person of Jane T. Herring effective as of the appointment of a successor guardian of the person
for Jane T. Herring, and payment of her final attorney fees and costs and guardian fees and costs.
A copy of the signed resignation of Pamela Woodward Blumer as the Plenary Guardian of the

Person of Jane T. Herring, an Incapacitated Person is attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “A”

i
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(the “Resignation™).

*—% 5. The combative and litigious nature of Arthur Herring, III, and the need to respond
-—._“*_____/-"-_-—

repeatedly to his false and unsubstantiated allegations relating to his mother’s care and his repeated

assertion of his own non-existent legal rights as Jane T. Herring’s son places an untenable burden

on the Petitioner that adversely impacts her ability to fulfill her fiduciary obligations to her other
u_______.-"-__'——-.'\.__ — ———

wards.

_,/% 6. In addition, Arthur Herring III’s public and defamatory allegations against the
" . _‘____"_._‘_‘____—-—-_r

Petitioner and his repeated petitions to remove his mother’s guardians have also made it

— e e ™

challenging for the Petitioner to maintain professional liability insurance coverage which is vital

e

1o her work as a professional fiduciary.

7. Petitioner’s counsel has spoken to Dennis Mahoney of IKOR of Eastern

Pennsylvania about serving as the successor plenary guardian of the person for Jane T. Herring,
an incapacitated person.

8. IKOR of Eastern Pennsylvania is located at 405 W. Village Lane, Chadds Ford,
Pennsylvania 19317 and has acted in a fiduciary capacity for clients and specifically has served as
professional guardian in many matters throughout the Commonwealth.

9. Mr. Mahoney, on behalf of IKOR of Eastern Pennsylvania, is willing to serve as
successor plenary guardian of the person for Jane T. Herring, an incapacitated person. A copy of
IKOR of Eastern Pennsylvania’s consent to serve as plenary successor guardian of the person for
Jane T. Herring, an incapacitated person is attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “B.”

GUARDIAN’S FEES AND ATTORNEY FEES

A. INVENTORY
10.  An inventory of the Incapacitated Person’s Estate has been filed.
11.  The initial inventory was filed by Dwane Lodgie on 10/27/2021 and listed the

total estate value of $1,413,629.04. A subsequent inventory was filed by the successor Guardian
, 2
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of the Estate, Ronald W. Fenstermacher, Jr. on August 12, 2022 and listed the total estate value of
$1,331,023.02.
12.  The present value of principal on hand of the estate is approximately $1,353,640.08
as listed on the Guardian of the Estate report dated May 12, 2023.
B. DEPENDENTS
13.  Please provide the names and addresses of any dependents of the Incapacitated
Person: None
C. CREDITORS
14. Please provide a statement or list of all known claims of the Incapacitated
Person’s Creditors: None
/> D. PREVIOUS DiSTRIBUTIONS
15.  Please provide a statement or list of all previous requested distributions (payments)
from the principal of the Estate of the Incapacitated Person allowed by the Court:
(@)  11/15/2021 - $4,212.50
(b)  02/10/2022 - $16,012.75
(c) 03/17/2022 - $18,596.00
(d)  03/23/2022 - $10,828.50
(e)  06/13/2022 - $4,266.26
(Hh  08/04/2022 - $16,522.25
(g  12/08/2022 -$3,650.00
(h)  01/24/2023 - $19,508.57
(i) 03/2/2023 - $2,024.00
G) 04/17/2023 - $49,837.87

(k)  06/27/2023 - $850.00
(m)  07/24/2023 - $8,166.89
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-——> (m)  11/2/2023 - $7.125.00

E. AMOUNT/ REASON FOR REQUEST

16. I am requesting an allowance (payment) from the principal of the estate of the

Incapacitated Person in the amount of the following:

—f> (a) Rarley Snyder, LLP — Additional Attorney fees and costs for the time period

beginning June 1, 2022 thrdugh September 29, 2022 and January 1, 2023 through the
present - $89.612.77; and
——>‘ (b) Pamela W. Blumer ~ Guardian fees and costs for the time period
beginning July 1, 2023 through the present - $3,000.00.
17. Please provide a detailed statement of the reason(s) for the request:
See Invoices for Barley Snyder, LLP and Pamela W. Blumer attached as Exhibits “C”

and “D,” respectively.

WHEREFORE, Petitioner hereby requests this Honorable Court to enter an order to
accept her resignation, appoint IKOR of Eastern Pennsylvania as the successor guardian of the
person and the payment of counsel fees and guardian fees.

)
Date: 11‘@ , 2023 Respectfully submitted,

BARLEY SNYDER, LLLP
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%ad M. Gelsmger, Esquxre

Attorney 1.D. No. 208233

Latisha Bernard Schuenemann, Esquire
Attorney 1.D. No. 204574

William R. Blumer, Esquire

Attorney 1.D. No. 59853

2755 Century Boulevard

Wyomissing, PA 19610

(610) 372-3500

Attorneys for Pamela Woodward Blumer,
Permanent Plenary Guardian of the Person, Jane
1. Herring, an Incapacitated Person
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IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS OF MONTGOMERY COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA

ORPHANS’ COURT DIVISION
IN RE: JANE T. HERRING, :
AN INCAPACITATED PERSON 3 FILE NO. 2021-X2110
ORDER
AND NOW, this day of ,202___, upon consideration of the within

Petition to Accept Resignation of Guardian of the Person by Thad M. Gelsinger, Esquire, Latisha
Bernard Schuenemann, Esquire, William R. Blumer, Esquire, and Barley Sayder, LLP, attorneys
for Pamela Woodward Blumer, Guardian of the Person, Jane T. Herring, an Incapacitated Person,
and the responses thereto, it is ORDERED AND DECREED that the Petition is GRANTED.

A. The resignation of Pamela W. Blumer, plenary Guardian of the Person of Jane T.
Herring, an incapacitated person, is hereby accepted and she is excused from serving as the
Guardian of the Person of Jane T. Herring, an Incapacitated Person, effective immediately.

B. IKOR of Eastern Pennsylvania is appointed as plenary Successor Guardian of the
Person of Jane T. Herring, an incapaciated person.

C. Pamela W. Blumer shall file with this Court her final report as guardian of the
person for Jane T. Herring within thirty (30) days from the date of this Order.

D. Ronald W, Fenstermacher, Jr., Esquire, Trustee and Guardian of the Estate of Jane
T. Herring, an Incapacitated person, is directed to pay the following:

‘ﬁzé% (1)  Barley Snyder, LLP in the amount of $ 89,612.77 plus an amount to exceed
Three Thousand Dollars ($3,000.00) plus costs and expenses related to their legal services

rendered in this matter and the filing of this Petition and any subsequent hearing thereto.
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(2) Pamela W. Blumer in the amount of $3,000.00 for her guardianship services
in this matter plus any additional guardian fees incurred from the date of this Order until the filing

of her final guardian report.

BY THE COURT:

MELISSA 8. STERLING, J.
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